




























































































































































































































































































































































































ORDINANCE NO. _06+24

“PM-$0O:3:2P m—aFeNJ:-AH-pnYal- & .ewasri', Ik:lalsrpaiegFé&efF-s &t
2 ing-&- 1 &-hese-dineeat:, rent-E&ee-in-alntHng-prpefie-or-rtllie
rgtsefwt-td-salhe-e Fmee-efmateals-wheh-h'lea = e-rsisatlo
erson-ae<| e-mantaine-in-god- r—eir

sal-leeestFeeofeAreeorapatsassieeif[1-by-Cate-iS-ofthe Rc_,me
CiyCeeentied"1angMd-P B ag-~¥dhaU-hemataaeE-in-geet-r—Ff=

“Cemmereia-Mdifduska l rpefiesmutme-te-relirments-ofte-applieable
T pe 1-eTprovdsitplanasrEaire-bythe Zain-OFdinBe+

*PU-30-4NOFLt-we -A-arsrisehtdingthe-pulc-rgt-of+.ay-adacette
teprpefy-sa-beJetEF -Ffomweegorplatgwtine esofe-(1)-i ¥ hes
(54-m)-Weeds'saH-be-c ned-as-an-g ses;-annual-plats-aR-—~\~seaton-oter-thn
t—-or-ss-bs; prvdeuhowee—tls«aﬂn sll~eot |Rehde~ealtvated -Fowers-aO

ees-eﬁ-tea-{%O)-i- e-(2$4—mmD-are—not-et--nitie-U'e-tme-S@eiHe-m-a-eotiee-ef
eFe-te-dosstee-Citymt-ifs-sole-dioerelien-andin-Mditioo-O &x-ether- m—eies
preteed-Frintiseereoselheweste-ee-e\tend-€ aae-Ee-easttheFeftme
rrpFewter-operandoroeeaf T eestalAEekKrEse inettett-te-ellg
ofwees-shal-eeeome-1s-a-tK-leA-aatfst-tel , pery- H-<sl-be-eeHeele- u the-s e
rmeadta,es"”

SonP130+41lis-adde-t-rdaTflows:

“PM-3B - :.-PrtHH-AH-wees-btses-keges;sh r—s;-Jne-antethe-llat
g'nt-Sal-beleltpmoed s-esfett -eesttet-te~ isicAofopmoFefveiele
& elng\0F88-rtlUeswe-Fd-0ft-mgl,a;-efstittehart;eiear-f
(edetan-EEFe;-be-harmels:- B the-pt le-heal h-aat-wel ¥ - -er-olJe,wise-elstttea
EekimC-te-te-eigefooror-eiistin-violation-ofae-other-coe-or-orinane-ofte
L1
&eo,-FPP-Jdr-7:l-is-aEde-to- rt-as-Flows:

“P/F30:-T7:}Reff , -WI:-Re&Fng-walserilr &&y-wa:shavinga-refFe)
MT — or- ta—tlfy (38 he-&m-one: () aEae-elevatioA-t- ooershal -ha>

rereed in-€hpe-8atthetp- ofthe wal-&. e-gam |—shaII be- frly fstee
an-epable-ofbeagnomly- 1 posd-loads—-s 1 1e—a@®_ne-1-goo0e
eotitoa:

S#H#HPM3 (G 72isatet- - rtM-Flows:
“PM-J3-—-—-D mvu—ceea:-Fenes-on-resideeteluspr pie- - ic-.elude

Se<"-PM-,0O8isaaede-o-F—eFflo[]

128



ORDINANCE NO. _06-24

"B 203 8 Moetor vebioles: Moter vehieles shall be subjest to the follewing
requirements-of Sections PM 30484 PM-304.8.2 and PM-301-8.3"

Section2AL- 38381 is-added-to-read-as-follows:

"PAL 203 8 1 Parking: Al motor vehicles shall be parkeed in approved off street
p&ﬂﬂﬁg-&fﬂﬂﬁ OF OR a8 %prwed street:- %e—p&rleng oF éavmg of motor vehneles over

é&?ﬁeas ﬁ?&hrbi%eé

Seetion£M-303 8.2 is added to read as follows:

"PAM 303 8.2 Repair, service o maintenance: The repairing, sepvicing; replacement of
parts: oF the perforenes obmeintonance work on 4 vebisle on & publie street oF any
private lands or premnises is prohibited, except as provided below:

(@) Major repatrs may be-performed by-an eccupant e&lthe»pfemise%&a vehiele
ewmed by%heﬁeeuﬁant -OF etheﬁeeoupam ot? the prem&ses in aﬁenelesedrgamge

eeasma!eaay-e&heféemmem-te %he aerghbefheed—E*amplesaﬁ majeﬁepaws
are: replasing & transmission, front or rear end, springs; shooks, valves, pistons,
ﬂ»ﬁgs eafbuwteref ethef majef@aﬁs ef—a me%ef BF eﬁgme Fepai%beéywefk

tby—Minor repairs-may be-performed by -an eccupant-of the premises-en-a-vehicle
ewned by the eccupant or other oecupant of the premises, provided-such repair
w0 porformned on ar impedietely in fomt ofthe premises. Brsnples ofannar
Fepairs are: tune-up: chanping ofeilfilter (provided ne publie space 15 polluted
oF- damdged)—%ﬂﬁg & Hats wplamng%b&ﬁeﬁ‘-kgh%a{bs—bﬁke& -Fotating

a1 The shove permstied repaes mioy be porfomned: provided that they aze
comploted-within fifteen (15)- days after their commencement and-thereafier the
vehicle upoen whieh the repairs are made is legally eperable upen any publie
street or highway: and further previded that pot mere than four (4 repair
pertods-of {ifteen {153 days-or less occur on or in front of any given premises
Seetion PAL-303.8 3 is added to read as foHows:
PM-303 Sziuluﬂk vehwles— Mjuﬁk«vehreleshan be kept-or maintained; except iR

Section-£2r1-303-8-4-is-added-te-read-as follows:

"PM-303.8 4 Unbieensed yehioles: Mot more than one {1} ewrrently unlicensed moter
vehicle shall be parked on any property o residential Zone, and such vehiele shall not at
any time be 14 state of major disassernbly or disrepatr, nor in the process of bewny
Apped-ardismantied:”

Seetion-PM-303.9 is-added-to-read-as-follows:

129



ORDINANCE NO. _06-24

"PA-303-9 Storage of cquipment Beoats; trailers, eampers, vans-end reereational
vehieles shell be stered in seeerdanee with the following sequence of parking
availability: {a) behind the front building Hne, en-an appreved surface; {b) in the

drcovsay which 19-construsted of eppraved meterely 2s regquired by Chaptes 25 sfthe
Reeckville-City-Code-entitled "Zoning -and-Planning"

"PA.-303 16 Public nuisance- All interior and exterior property area and premises
ghell bo memtained 4o a0 to prevent the ereatior oleny mubhe suiseeee a5 dalined in dis
eode™
Seotion {4202 H is added to read as follows:

M. 203 12 Abandoned rofrigerators: Ne teebex, refriserator, freezer, or other
lprpe-cichght-canteiner, which4s ne-longer uoed for colmperation perpasey, shatl be

wleesd, kepk stored of disearded on eny pubhe or private propery watheut the atteched
doers;-hinges, tocks-or latehes-being first remeved:”

"PM-3203 12 OQutdoor ilunination A persen may not operate any eutdosor artifieial
dhamination device-on private prop 41 sueh o manner a5 to tnterfore with-the vse o
srievrrent of ahuthag of pearby propery
Seetion2hi-303.43 ts-added to read as-foHows:

TPA-363. 43 Lehiolosfor habttatton profbried: Mo-tmiler reercation vehiele, cor of
truele shatl be brought within the corporate hmits of the City for the purpese of habitation
ard-delbag thersin for o popnd of wmere-then twenty-four howrs”

"R 202 Lt Slegrlinmey of G slpsbt- ofwanys Mo cogunant ep avwaer of agy
dwelling, dweling unit, or property bordenng any street aley o sght-of way; shall
éepes&ga«rbage—re&ase -er tbbish into-the nght-of way, sireet or alley abutting the

AL 3043 Street nembers:

mdast-ﬂe} ﬁﬁd-mu}a-f&mﬂy-fes&deﬁaa{»stmemfe—m dﬁp}ey—faeﬁig&e-ﬁreﬁt»w
Line and at all entranees faeing patking ereas, numerals-at-least six (6) inches-in
height designeting the address assigned to the strueture by the City.

e}—AHaaddfess dfsphys shau be-pestedeneeﬂm\sﬂaghaekgfeuad étsp!ayeé e

130



ORDINANCE NO. _06-24

clearly visible from such parking areas, When a structure has move than ene (1)
address: rumerals shall be used to designate the address in sequence,”
Seetion PAL 304 745 amended to read as foows:

"PA 304, 2 Roofs and drainage: The roof and flashing shall be sound, tight, and not
have defects which might admit rain. Roof drainage shall be adequate to preveat
dampness or deterioration in the walls or interior portion of the building. Reefwater shall
not be discharged onto an abutting or adjaeent property.”
Seetion-PM-304.71is-added te-read as folows:

”I’M 304 74 Gam*demspeu&s anéap!askb!oel&- Al-l feefi&ef—’al! buﬂd-mgs

aﬂérspla%hb!eeke %m%alled ma&appmved -FRAnRNer- anémaan%ameé unebstrueted aﬂd in
goad repair $0 as to assist in property sterm drainage.”
Seetion-PM-364.18 is deleted.

Section-PM-304-13-is-amended-to-read-as follows:

VP 36443 Hendratty and suardraits: Bveny flight of stais which is three or mere
asers high shell have a handeail on at least ene {4 side of the stair, and every open
portion-of a stair-Janding-or balcony which-is more-than thirty (30) inches (762 mm)
above the floor or grade below shall have guardrails: Required handrails and guardeails
shall meet the requirements set forth in the Building Code and One and Twe-famity
Dwelling Cede referenced in Chapter 8. -Existing handrails and guardrails which-do not
feet the specifie requirements of-these sodes, and which are deerned by the building
official to-be- safe~ma»y femam-mplae&wﬁheut akefaﬂeﬂ—ﬁveﬁt Mﬂé%%d g’d&l'éi-'aﬂ

.....

Seetion-PM-304. 15 is-amendod-to-read-as-follows:

"BAM 30415 Dwwect sereens: Hvery doer, window and other vutside opening used or
requited for ventilation purposes serviag any building contaimng habitable reens, food
preparation areas, f0od service areas, of any areas where products used in food (r human
eensumption are processed, manufactured, packaged or stored, shall be supplied with
approved tghtly fitting screens of not less than 6 mesh per inch and every swinging
door shall have & self closing deviee 1 good working condition. Excephion: Sereen doors
Shﬂﬂ-ﬂ@%-be{eqmé—fef ot &wmgmg éBGPb—OF'GMWG eﬁepenmgswhwhmake

sepeﬂaaﬂans areempleyeé—
Seaction LA 304,464 is added 1o read as follows:

"PAL 304 46 1 Deadlocks and deadbolts: Bvery owaer andior operator shall supply
and ipstall on every exitway door which serves o5 a8 eatrence door 10 an wmdividual
dwelling unit-a vertical bolt deadlock or a- deadbelt-with at least a one-half~inch throw:
Sueh deadbek anddeaé{ateh shall- be eapabl&ef»bemg«leeked ‘mdﬂnleekeéw}&h & key«af

at- %he ésefeaen ef-t-he—eeée—eﬂie&a}—l;*& deeps sha&l be eapable otlbemg epeneé frem %he

131



ORDINANCE NO. _06-24

Seetton 21304 1915 added to read as follows:
"PM&OHQ Areaway pm&eeaana Adl-window- weliﬁ%eﬁef éeefﬁpemgs

RS e85 - ODERBC -Are AW Y-S -OVer-WeRiy -0 RERES-1

belew adjaeent gfeuﬂd level sha!l be provided with & heﬁmﬁwgnu&veﬁw&fmhﬂg
thirty (30) inches in height or other epproved protection-All grilles; railings and
eovertiigs shall be firmly fastened and copeble of bearing normally imposed loads and

"RA-305.7 Handratls and guardrails Every {light of stairs whieh in three or more
rsers-high-shall- have o handrat -on-at least one (1) side of the stair, and-every open
porton of o steir-lending ot baleony-which is-more then thisty (30) inehes (762 mn)
abeve the floor of srade below shell have guardrails. Required handrails and guardreils
Dwelling Code referenced in Chapter & Existing handrails and muardrarls whieh do-ret
meet-the speeifie requirements-of these-codes-and-which-are-deemed by-the building
eﬁiemhevbeﬁ&feﬁeyfemamm pl&cewfheut akem&eﬁ—Evefy haﬂémﬂ aﬂé guevdﬁml

Seetton-PA-3035 815 added-to read as foHews:

“PM-305 & dnterior doors and hardware: Every bedroom and bathroomshall heve o
deor which provides-privaey.- This deor shall be maintained in good condition and havea
deorlateh-or-otherlocking-deviee-that-is-operable-and under- the-control-of the-oecupant
so that privacy is maintained -within sueh room:"

Sectiorn LAL-205 245 added to read as follows:

drawer, eabinet, shelf, and venity shall be maintained in-a safe-sound, ard in goed repaif
with-appropriate hardware”

Section-PM-3054613-added to-read-as-follows:

"PAL-305 40 Bathroom-andfitehenfloors: Every totlet; bathroom end kitchen Hloor
surfaee shall be eonstrueted and matntained so-as to be substantially imperviots-to water
and-so-as-to-permit sueh Hloor-to-be-easily kept-in-a clean-and santtary conditien.”
Seetion-RAL-305. 4 is-added-toread a5 follows:

”PM-&G&# Fmeﬁemdempness— Geuaﬁ»basemems ane erawl spaeesm»evefy

éampness
Seation-RAL-305. 42 isadded o read-as-follows:

that-part-of the-stracture-or-premises-thereof which-he-occupies;-controls-oruses;in-a

132



ORDINANCE NO. _06-24

eloas end samtary condition. Bvery svwner andier operater ofa dwellne contmmng twe
(2} oF more dweﬂiﬂg umts—shal-l»mamta-m-&a a»eleaaﬂad samitary condition the shared or

Seetion LA 265 13 & added to-read-as felows:

P2 30542 Supplied fixtere and equipment: The owner, operator of occupant efa
structure or patt thereof shall keep the supplied equipment and fixtures therein clean and
sapitary; and shall be responsible-for the exercise of reasonable cate in their proper use
Seetion PAL-305 L4 is added to read as foHows:

"PM-385 14 Furnished bv vceupant The equipment and fixtures fumished by the
oecupant of a structure shall be properly installed, and shall be matatained in good
working condibion, kept clean and sanitary. nd free of defeets, leaks, or abstimictions "

TEAL 205 15 Sanitary meadntenances: Beery gecupant of o dwethag o dwelbng vast shall
leeep e elean aﬂd samtafy oenémen thaé%ef—%he drwel»lmgﬂféweﬂmgﬁm{ and—&he

mc—ladebu&—wae%%m&eé to- &e«ﬁellewmgﬁaﬁdard%-
“(a} Fleers ﬂeer eeveﬁngs and ethef walkm»g surfaees shall-be-kept» elean-aﬂd#ee

greasy ﬁ!m—seei—aaé—aﬁy e%hef mqamt-afy maaeﬁ
—(c)—Plumbmg ﬁx{ufes-sha!{ b&kept-m ﬁe}eaﬂ anésamafy eeaémear- aaé-ﬂe

ebs%eaes—eﬁ sueh—ﬁ*tace OF- e’ﬁaaj‘ l-mes eeaneeteé {hepete—Sve;yeeeupam
shall be responsible for the axersiso obwoasenable core w the proper use apd
operation thereof."
“(d) Hoods and duets over kitchen ranges shall be eleaned by the eceupant at least
Seetion LM 30632 is amended to read as follows:
P 38632 Containers: The owner of eperator of every property producing
goebaze sholl provide n sutficient quantihes, aad at ol hmes cense to beo ased, leelprood
appfeveéueemam prewdeei«wﬁh elebeﬁttmgeeveﬁ&* the storage-of such-materals

Seerion P 2064 45 added 1o read a5 follows:

i’PMf 306 4baréage mébwk end ashes— Eer evear«baﬂdmg»eemafmng«thfee-(—})-ef

aH dwelhagm-a&an aéequa&eﬂumber e# meep&aele&m%ewh&ehgafbage-mbbwhﬂnd
ashes from the dwelling unit receptacies may be emptied for storage between the days of

133



ORDINANCE NO. _06-24

Seetion-PM-3072-is-arpended-as-follows:
M-&Q#é%ﬁeﬁ—%e ewnef—mé#efﬁpefatefeﬁ aﬂy -structure- shal{ be-respeﬁslble

Seetion-£A-307-5 1s-arnended-as follows:
"PM 393—5 Qeeupa»p%&eeeﬂpam-efaﬁy -Strueture- shal’rbefespeﬁs*b}e -fef

pfewde #éfi&afbemge-efefm-byfedems |
Section PM-307-6-i5-added as-follows:

"RAL 207 6 Continned rodent tnfestation: Contirving or repented tneidents of rodent
mfes%a%&eﬁ shal{ fequife-themste}ia&e&ef fatpfeeﬂﬂﬂéaﬁeﬁ%mpfeeﬁwaﬂs- ﬂeef eﬁether

Seetion PAM-404-2 i15-emended 1o vead as-follows:
"PM-%?}%Respenﬂbckw— %&ewaefaﬁd#ef epefﬁtefef%he stmetufeshal} -provide

the following requirements-of this artele.”
Section PM-405. 10 is amended to read as follows:

“PM-103-10-Food preparation:-All-spaces-used-or-intended-to-be-used-for-foed
preparation shall ¢ontain suitable spaee-and-equipment-to-store prepare-and serve-foeds
1t &-sanitery menner.There-shall-be-adequate faetlities-and-serviees-for-the senitary
disposal of teed wastes and refuse, neluding facilities for temporary storage where
fnesessary.”

Seetion £41-560+2 ts amended-to-read-as follows:

"PM-581.2 Responsibility: The ewner-andior operator-of the-strueture-shall provide
A-persont shall not vecupy a5 owner-oecupant of permit enother person t0 oecupy or use
eny-stroeture-or portion thereof or premises whieh dees not eomply with the fellewing
requirements ¢ this artiele”

Seetion PA-5065 is-added as follews:

"RAL- 38065 Protection Where the heatng {acilities of any dweling or dwelling umt
are-under the-control-of the eccupent thereof it shall be the responsibility of the ceeupont
te- operate the heating feeilities in order to maintain abeve freering temperatures at atl
times in all porttons of the dwetling or dwelling unit and the premises thereof whieh he of
she-oceupies-and-controls-so-a3 to-prevent-ijury or damage-to-water pipes-and

134



ORDINANCE NO. _06-24

Section PAL-507 3 is-added to read as folows:

"RM 3073 Kxisting well and septic systems: Al exstiag well and septic systems
shall be maintained in good operating coadition: Upon fatlure of the septie system; the
owsner or ocoupant shall vacate the building or eonnect to-the public water and sewer
system,”

Seetion PM 5084 ts amended to-read as folows:

open areas o/ {he - PrEFRises shal! ﬂet he éiseharged 7 FRANHer thawreates a puhl-m
nuisance ofF causes direct water flow across oF onto an abutiing or adjacent propesty.”

Section-PA-601-2 is-amended-to-read-as-follows:

"PM-661. 2 Responsibitity The ewner andlor operater of the steueture shall provide
and matntain sueh mechanieal and electrical facilities and equipment in-compliance with
thess raquirements. A person shall not occupy as owner oceupant of permit another
PEFISR-40 GECUPY OF USE any slrusturs or porhen thereel on prerises which-does net
comply with the following requiresents-of this article.”

Section PAL-602.2 1s amended to vead as follows:

"PM-602.2 Residential buitdings Every owner of operator of any structure whe
rents, leases, of leis one (1) or mere dwelling units shall supply sufficient heat to the
sccupants thereof during the period from Oetober 1 to May 1 to maintain a room
temperature of not ess than sbaty-five(65) degrees E. (18 dogrees € ) in all habitable
spaees bathrooms ané teﬂe%reems éuﬂag &he heursbehveen 6—-3@ &m~and—19-’>0 p H:

(1 F éamgethef he% %e%mpesatafe shaﬂ-b&meaﬂuveé ata- pem%-%hm (»3) feet (914 |
mm) above the floorand three (3) feet (914 mm) from the extener walls. Exeephion:
When t-he ex&eﬁer—tempefatafe kusbelewzem {O}degsees F, H»Srdegrees Q—}and -the

éegfeeer Hééegrees—@ )&hal% beamamtameéat»all t«}mes
Seetion PM-6023-is-amended-to-read-as-folows:

“PM-602 3 Norresidential struetires. Hvery enclosed eecupied work space shall be
supphied with sufficient-heat during the-pedod from October 1 through May 15 te
maintain-a temperatore of pot less than 65 degrees 18 degrees € during alt working

Exceptions: 1. Processing sterage and operation areas that require eoohing or special

2. Aveas in which-persons are primaantly engaged in vigorous physieal activities.”
Seetion PAL-683. 3 is amended to read as foHows:

COTRPOReRtS; aad accessenes 0 every heating: eooking and water heating deviee shal be
mmamed ~ﬁ=ee frem-«leaks-and obstme&ms%—kep&»ﬁamomﬂg pmpeﬂy 5035 %&be

aeeevdaneewﬂh—&h&prevmas ef—the bmldmg-eeée-—er etheriaws of efdmames

135



ORDINANCE NO. _06-24

appheable thereto. Pertable eooking equipment is prohibiled,-except-for-approved
residential type food traya of selvers which are heated by ¢ ¢andle or aleohel tamp:"

Seetion PM-603-3.1is-added-to read as follows:

aéequa&efeﬁhe_&empemry presewaheﬁ e?peﬁshahiefeeés-Sueba ﬁm&-shall-be-eapable
of maintaining an everage teraperature below fory five {45} degrees Enhrenbett, and
shall-be-properly instelled, operated-and meintained, end shell be kept in & elean and
senitary-conditon.”

“PM-603.8-Chimate control: When faeilities for interior elimate-control-theating,
eooling-andior humidity) are integral funetions of struetures-used-as-dwelling-units-or
other occupanetes, suech facthities shall be maintained and operated w2 & continuous

Seetion PAL-605 2 is-emended to-read-as-foHews:

2R2A1-603.2 Receptactes: Every hebitable spaee in & dwelling chall-centain-at-least
two-seperate-ord remete reeeptacie eutlets: Every laundry erce shall-contein et least-one
{1} grounded type receptacle- Every bathreom-shall-contain at least one (1) receptaele
pfeseeted%y 8- greaﬁd«faukmm gt

"RAL-686.4 Generels Elevators; dumbwatters and escalators shal-be maintained to
sustamn-sefely all-posed-loads-to-operate properly end in eomphianece with all State
regwtations, and to be feee from physteal and {fice hazards."

LPM-704-2 Responsibility: The owner andier operator of the strueture shall provide
regquiresnents of the fire code. A person-shal Aot ocenpy 85 owaer-Gecupant of perfnit
anethef ?efseﬂ-{e eeeupy efuseaﬂy - strpeture e%peﬁ &hesee#ev—prem«se&wheh does ot

Seetion PAM-7202.5 4 15 added-asfeHows:

PAE-202.5. 4 Notifieation of exits= Jt shall be the responsibility of the owner, e his

operator of-agent;-to-notify-the-oceupant-of the passageway-to-all-required-exits;-exeeptin
these hotels or motels where & seale-floor plen-of the passageways and-exis-is- posted in
eaeh room."

Seetion PM-702.6 is amended to read as follows:
m-?@z?-é-é'eﬁféde# enelesu%e—-M-eeméers&emagﬂﬁ eeeapam%aé»gfe&tef&aﬂ

mevemem e{-' smeke AH tfaaemns—{e&vees-deefs-eﬂd«aéhes -opentigs-shall- be eleseéﬂr
shall-be-self closing-exeept a5 may be permitted by the Building Codelisted in-Chapter
&

136



ORDINANCE NO. _06-24

1P 702 7 Dead-end travel distanee:-Al-corriders-that serve-more- than-one (1) exit
shall provide direet connection 10 such exits. The lengih of #+ dead end corridor shall et
exceed that permitied by the Building Cede listed-in-Chapter 8."

Seetion-PAM-702-9 is-amended-to-read-as-follows:

"PA T02 4 Stainvaps, handratls and guards: Bvery exterior and interior fight of
stairs having three or more tisers shall have a handrail, and every open portion of a stair,
Mﬁg-e;%aleeaywhieh%mm-%aaé@énehes—abeve&he-ﬂee%ergmé&belew-shau
have-suards andrai 1 e-noatlae han 309nches nar-more-than ; as-hioh

laadmg e#wal&mgeurféee%—@uaféﬂhaﬂ«netbe Je%aaan %mehes hﬁgh«abeve &he ﬂeef
of the landing on the baleony, porch; deck-or other walking surfaces.”

4.~—Mndew—s§41—height~ae-grea&enhan«tbﬂy-feurﬂ%ehes&em&he—imeﬂer-ﬂeef
ipmediately below e

2. Window mmust not-opentito an extenor windew well lesy than three feet wide

3. Window must have a mintmum net clear opening of five (5} square feet, with a
minimun olear opening height of twenty four {24) inches and ¢ minimum clear
width-dimension of twenty tnches:

In Hew ofa windew which meets the requitements above, such room may have an
exterior door approved for epmergency egress of rescue, o shal have aceess to net fess
than tweo approved-independent-exits

EXCEPTON: Buildings equipped throughout with & complete automatie five
sappressie&sys%em#

BM-Z62. 43 Emergeney fghing: Fmefgeneykghaﬂg—faeﬂmebﬂ‘bfmeaaseiegvess
shall be provided and mainiained for every building of structure where reguired by the
NEPA 101-Life Safety Code”

SeetionPAM-F02 14 is-added to read as follows:

2202 L4 Eiee safety instrnetions: Hotels, mezels, apartment houses; and-al other
residential oceupaneies except one and two-family dwellings, shall have a printed copy of
fire sutety-instroctions permanently and conspicuously pested in-eash vecupaney unit and
a%»ether%oaﬂens as*eqweé by Ghe Dw&s&ea eﬂﬁspeetm bemees«%e #e*% and-pes%mg

Section-PM-702-15-is-added to read-as follows:

"PM 702 15 Means of-egress The occupant of any dwelling or dwelling unit shall

137



ORDINANCE NO. _06-24

* ¥ %

Saction-LA-105.4-1-15-added-to-read-asfollows:

ﬂ

-al- afesfeqa-wed by-ﬂae-«BO@A—BHtlémg Gede keted in- Chapter 8= "
Seotion-PM- 1055 15 amended to read ag follows:

mam%amed -8s- mayée«feq«mfed bye&hef ﬁppheabiewlegis}&aen of efémanee
Seetion PAM-705.8 s added {0 read-as follows:

TRAM-ZOS B Other standards upplicabte This section 15 intended to be ysed with and
supplemented by the applicable provisions ef the National Fire Protection-Asseetation
stfmdafésNes—J{ HQSQ}—?%BH—QS%)—&M# Wa—whiehﬂfehefebymeeﬁpem%-by

ané-fegalaaens aéepted prESHaRt- &hefet& &ﬁd ihe refefeﬂeed s%aﬂéefés the pievw}eﬂ ef
this-eode shall-prevail-"

138



ORDINANCE NO. _06-24

ARTICLE XIII. EXISTING BUILDING CODE
DIVISION 1. GENERALLY

Sec. 5-289. Scope.

The provisions of this article apply to existing buildings in accordance with the Maryland
Building Rehabilitation Code (COMAR 09.12.58) and the International Existing Building Code.

* ok ok
DIVISION 2. TECHNICAL STANDARDS

Sec. 5-291. Maryland Building Rehabilitation Code (COMAR 09.12.58).

The Maryland Building Rehabilitation Code (COMAR 09.12.58) dated-March-25;-2019-as
may be amended from time to time, and as may hereby be amended, is adopted by reference. One
(1) copy of such publication, as adopted, shall be housed by the Inspection Services Division and
made available for inspection by the public during regular office hours.

Sec. 5-292. Same — Amendments

The ICC International Existing Building Code, 2021 Edition (IEBC), as incorporated by
reference and amended in COMAR 09.12.58. is amended in the following respects:

Section 101.1 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Existing Building Code of

the City of Rockville, hereinafter referred to as ‘‘this code.”

Section 101.6 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows:

101.6 Appendices. Appendices A and C, and Resource A are adopted as part of
this code.

Section 101.2.1 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows:

101.2.1 Application of fire code. Where work regulated by this code is also
regulated by the construction requirements for existing buildings in Chapter 9 of
the Rockville City Code, such work shall comply with applicable requirements in
both codes.

Section 102.4.1 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows:

102.4.1 Conflicts. Where conflicts occur between provisions of this code and
referenced codes and standards, the most restrictive provisions shall apply.

Section 102.6 is added to the IEBC to read as follows:

102.6 Relation to the Maryland Building Rehabilitation Code. Where conflicts
occur between provisions of the Maryland Building Rehabilitation Code and this

139



ORDINANCE NO. _06-24

code, the most restrictive provisions shall apply. In all cases, the minimum
requirements of the Maryland Building Rehabilitation Code shall be met.

Sections 102.7 is added to the IEBC to read as follows:

102.7 Relation to the Maryland Accessibility Code. The Maryland
Accessibility Code (COMAR 09.12.53) is incorporated by reference. Where

conflicts occur between provisions of the Maryland Accessibility Code and this

code, the provisions providing the greatest level of access, as determined by the

Building Official, shall apply. In all cases, the minimum requirements of the
Maryland Accessibility Code shall be met.

Section 103 of the IEBC is deleted in its entirety.

Section 105.2 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows:

105.2 Work exempt from permit. Exemptions from permit requirements of this

code shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to be done in any
manner in violation of the provisions of this code or any other laws or ordinances of
this jurisdiction. Permits shall not be required for the following:

1. Building:

Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar
finish work.

Temporary motion picture, television, and theater stage sets and scenery.

Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or agricultural purposes,
and not including service systems.

Window awnings supported by an exterior wall of Group R-3 or Group U
occupancies.

Nonfixed and movable cases, counters and partitions not over 5 feet

9 inches {1753 mm) in height.

2. Electrical:

1.

3. Gas:

Repairs and maintenance: Minor repair work, including the replacement

of lamps or the connection of approved portable electrical equipment
to approved permanently installed receptacles.

Radio and television transmitting stations: The provisions of this code

shall not apply to electrical equipment used for radio and television
transmissions, but do apply to equipment and wiring for power supply, the

installations of towers and antennas.

Temporary testing systems: A permit shall not be required for the
installation of any temporary system required for the testing or servicing
of electrical equipment or apparatus.

Portable heating appliance.

140



ORDINANCE NO. _06-24

2.

Replacement of any minor part that does not alter approval of equipment

or make such equipment unsafe.

4. Mechanical:

1.

2
3.
4

Portable heating appliance.

Portable ventilation equipment.

Portable cooling unit.

Steam, hot or chilled water piping within any heating or cooling
equipment regulated by this code.

Replacement of any part that does not alter its approval or make it unsafe.

Portable evaporative cooler.

Self-contained refrigeration system containing 10 pounds (4.54 kg) or less
of refrigerant and actuated by motors of 1 horsepower (746 W) or less.

5. Plumbing:

The stopping of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste or vent pipe; provided,
however, that if any concealed trap, drainpipe, water, soil, waste or vent
pipe becomes defective and it becomes necessary to remove and replace
the same with new material, such work shall be considered as new work
and a permit shall be obtained and inspection made as provided in this
code.

The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks in pipes, valves or
fixtures, and the removal and reinstallation of water closets, provided that
such repairs do not involve or require the replacement or rearrangement of
valves, pipes or fixtures.

Section 106.2.1.1 is added to the IEBC to read as follows:

106.2.1.1 Design Professional. All commercial and multifamily construction

documents shall be prepared by a Maryland Licensed registered design

professional. Construction documents shall be signed, sealed, and include the

titleblock certification statement as required by Maryland State law (COMAR

09.21.02.04 and 09.23.03.09)

Section 106.2.3 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows:

106.2.3 Means of egress.The construction documents shall show in sufficient

detail the location, construction, size and character of all portions of the means of

egress in compliance with the provisions of this code. The construction

documents shall designate the number of occupants to be accommodated in every

work area of every floor and in all affected rooms and spaces.

Section 106.3.3 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows:

106.3.3 Phased approval. The building official is authorized to issue a permit for

the construction of foundations or any other part of a building or structure prior to

the construction documents for the whole building or structure having been

141



ORDINANCE NO. _06-24

approved. The application for foundation permit shall include all relevant
information, including but not limited to: setbacks. proposed building height and

area, building construction type, and structural criteria. The holder of such permit

for the foundation of a building or structure shall proceed at the holder's own risk

with the building operation and without assurance that a permit for the entire
structure will be granted.

Section 106.3.3.1 is added to the IEBC to read as follows:

106.3.3.1 Phased construction. Where construction of a building or structure is

proposed to be phased, the applicant shall include a phasing plan and narrative
with the submittal of construction documents. Such phasing plan shall clearly

identify the extent of the work area included in each phase and clearly identi

how elements such as the means of egress, active and passive fire protection,
accessible routes, and restroom access will be provided or maintained during

construction.
Section 108.2 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows:

108.2 Schedule of permit fees. The fees shall be as established by resolution of
the Mayor and Council.

Section 108.4 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows:
108.4 Work commencing before permit issuance. Any person who commences
work on an existing building, except as provided for in Section 105.1. before

obtaining the necessary permits shall be subject to an investigation fee as set forth
by resolution, and 100 percent of the usual permit fee.

Section 108.6 of the IEBC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 110.1.1 is added to the IEBC to read as follows:

110.1.1 Change of tenant or ownership. Whenever the ownership or tenancy of
any part of a non-residential building or space changes, application must be made
for a certificate of occupancy. Any violations of this Section or any applicable

code as related to fire or life safety codes must be corrected prior to the issuance

of the certificate of occupancy.
Section 110.3 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows:

110.3 Temporary Occupancy. The building official may issue a temporary

occupancy permit. A temporary occupancy permit may be issued if none of the

remaining conditions to be complied with are a health or safety hazard.

A temporary occupancy permit may not be issued for a single-unit detached
dwelling.

A temporary occupancy permit is valid for a period not to exceed thirty (30} days,
in the discretion of the Building Official.

For good cause, the Building Official may extend a temporary occupancy permit
when requested for additional periods, in accordance with the City of Rockville

142



ORDINANCE NO. _06-24

Zoning Ordinance Section 25.07.12: however no temporary occupancy permit,
including any extensions, will be valid for more than sixty (60} days.

Section 112.] of the IEBC is amended to read as follows:

112.1 Board of Adjustments and Appeals. Appeals of administrative
interpretations or decisions made by the Code Official shall be administered in
accordance with Chapter 5, Article I, Section 5-12 of the Rockville City Code.

Sections 112.2, 112.3 and 112.4 of the IEBC are deleted in their entirety.
Notwithstanding Section 09.12.58.03(C)(6) of the Maryland Rehabilitation Code, Section
306 of the IEBC shall apply to existing buildings.

Section 306.2 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows:

306.2 Design. Buildings and facilities shall be designed and constructed to be
accessible in accordance with this code, the Maryland Accessibility Code
(COMAR 09.12.53), and the alteration and existing building provisions in ICC
Al117.1, as applicable.

Chapter 16 of the IEBC is amended by replacing all references to the International Fire
Code with Chapter 9 of the Rockville City Code.

Secs. 5-292293—5-300 Reserved.

143



ORDINANCE NO. _06-24

ARTICLE XI1V. GREEN BUILDING REGULATIONS

* % %

DIVISION 2. ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT

Sec. 5-311. Administration.

(a)

(b)

The Chief of Zoning or his/her-their designee will review projects for compliance
with this article during the design phase of new construction. This includes:

(1) Reviewing the submitted green building checklists and supporting
documentation for completeness and accuracy, as it pertains to site
development.

The Chief of Inspection Services or his/her-their designee will review projects for
compliance with this article during the design phase of new construction. This
includes:

(1) Reviewing the submitted green building checklists and supporting
documentation for completeness and accuracy, as it pertains to building
construction.

Sec. 5-312. Enforcement.

The Chief of Inspection Services or histhes~their designee will review projects for
compliance with this article during construction and prior to occupancy. This includes:

* %k %k

DIVISION 3. DEFINITIONS

Sec. 5-316. Definitions.

Words defined in this article are intended only for use with sections of this article or any
document referred to in this article.

* % X

City Manager means the City Manager for the City of Rockville, or hisfer-their designee.

* % ok

DIVISION 4. NON-RESIDENTIAL AND MULTI-UNIT RESIDENTIAL GREEN

BUILDINGS

144



ORDINANCE NO. _06-24

Sec. 5-322. Same—Amendments.

The ICC International Green Construction Code, 2015 Edition (IgCC), is amended in the
following respects:

* %k Xk

Section 102.6 of the 1gCC is amended to read as follows:

102.6 Existing structures. The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the
date of adoption of this code shall be permitted to continue without change, except
as is specifically covered in this code, the International Building Code, the
International Existing Building Code, or the Rockville Fire Code, or as is deemed

necessary by the eade-affieial-Building Official for the general safety and welfare

of building occupants and the public.
Section 106.1 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

106.1 Required. Any owner or authorized agent who intends to construct, enlarge,
alter, repair, move, demolish, or change the occupancy of a building or structure,
or to erect, install, enlarge, alter, repair, remove, convert or replace any energy,
electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system, the installation of which is
regulated by this code, or to cause any such work to be done, shall first make
application to the eede-effieial-Building Official and obtain the required permit
under the applicable code or regulation relevant to the intended work. A Green
Building application will be filed with the Inspection Services Division; however,
a separate permit shall not be issued under this code. Exemptions from permit
requirements shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to be done in
any manner in violation of the provisions of this code or any other applicable laws,
codes or ordinances of this jurisdiction.

L
Section 108 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

108 Board of Adjustments and Appeals. Appeals of administrative
interpretations or decisions made by the eede-effisial-Building Official shall be
administered in accordance with Chapter 5, Article I, Section 5-12 of the Rockville
City Code.

Section 301.1.1 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

301.1.1 Application. The requirements contained in this code are applicable to
buildings, or portions of buildings. As indicated in Section 101.3, these buildings
shall meet either the requirements of ASHRAE 189.1 or the requirements contained
in this code or demonstrate compliance using an equivalent option that must be first

145



ORDINANCE NO. _06-24

* % %

approved by the eede—official Building Official and where the applicant
demonstrates equivalency and compliance.

Section 902.1.1.1 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

902.1.1.1 Qualifications of approved agencies. An approved agency shall be
qualified and shall demonstrate competence, to the satisfaction of the eede-offieial
Building Official, for the commissioning of the particular type of construction or
operation. The registered design professional in responsible charge and engineers
of record involved in the design of the project are permitted to act as the approved
agency provided those personnel meet the qualification requirements of this section
to the satisfaction of the eede-effieial-Building Official. The approved agency shall
provide written documentation to the eede-effieial-Building Official demonstrating
competence and relevant experience or training. Experience or training shall be
considered relevant where the documented experience or training is related in
complexity to the same type of commissioning activities for projects of similar
complexity and material qualities.

Section A103.2 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

* k%

A103.2 Required number of and selection of project electives. A total of not less
than 10 project electives shall be selected by the owner or the owner's authorized
agent from Table A103.2. Selected project electives shall be applied as mandatory
requirements for the project. Selected project electives shall be communicated to
the eede-efficial-Building Official by means of checking the appropriate boxes in
the tables and providing a copy of the tables, or by inclusion of a list of selected
project electives, with the construction documents.

DIVISION S. ONE- AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLING REQUIREMENTS

Sec. 5-333. Rockville Green Homes required.

Homes must achieve a minimum Silver performance level in Chapters S through 10 of the
ICC 700-2015 (National Green Building Standard) or equivalent system that must be first

approved by the eode-offieial-Building Official and where the applicant demonstrates equivalency
and compliance.

146



ORDINANCE NO. _06-24

SECTION II - This ordinance shall become effective on May 29, 2024, except for the following
amendments, which shall become effective on December 1, 2024:
- Incorporation of Chapter 11 of the IBC, 2021 Edition, as amended by Section 5-87 this
ordinance;
- Incorporation of the following sections of the IECC, 2021 Edition, as amended by
Section 5-162 of this ordinance: Sections C402.1.1; C402.1.1.1; C402.1.2; C403.4.1.6;
C404.2.1; C404.10; C405.2; C405.13; C405.14; C405.14.1; C405.15; C405.15.1;
C405.16, including all subsections; C406.1; C406.5.1; R401.2.5; R402.1; R403.1.1;
R403.5.4; R404.4, including all subsections; R404.5, including all subsections; R404.6,
including all subsections; R404.7, including all subsections; and
- Incorporation of Section 306 of the IEBC, 2021 Edition, as amended by Section 5-292

of this ordinance.

2k 2 2k 3k 2k ok sk 2k sk 3k ok ok 2k ok 2k sk 3k sk ok 3k ok 2k ok 3k ok ok 3k ok 3k ok ok k ok

NOTE: Strikethreugh indicates material deleted.

Underlining indicates material added.

Asterisks * * * indicate material unchanged by this ordinance.

I hereby certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of an Ordinance

adopted by the Mayor and Council of Rockville at its meeting of May 20, 2024.

ylor-Fervell

Sara Ta
City Clerk/Director of Council Operation

147






