






























































































































































































































































ORDINANCE NO. 06•24 

"P.M $03.3.2 Priwd.e aFeNJ: AH pnYa� tiri.,.eways, i,•,ralk:-.•1a�s, patieg ftfl& eff street 
per4Eing .area !ffl&U he se d:fainee as te ,,ro•,cent El&mege in alntHin:g propeff:ies or r,ttl:llie 
rignts efwtt;t tlftd sliall he eeftSmtetee efmaterials wh-ieh ha•1e a surfe.ee resistant �o 
erosion; ane-wll-ee maintained in good repeir." 

•lR-e!HeeMi.al dFWe'h'ays afid off sueet pBFIEiatg Ofeas 00115uueled after April l, l 991,
shaU l:Je eesstftief:ed of eoAerele or a6phalt $6 si,eeif� &'J' Chapter i!S of the Rock .. ,me 
City Cetle entitled 11�aing Md Platmiag'' ftfld 9haU he maifltaineEI in geetl reJ:lftif." 

"Cemmereial Md iflduskialt,repefties,,must meet the req1:tirements of the applieable 
ttse pemii-t entJ--ttpproved site plan. as reEJaired by the Zoain:g OFdin.Bfl:ee." 

�io,•i PM' JBJ. 4 is 1Hfteaded io read as feH01ns: 

"PU 303. 4 N�fottS weeth: AH areas, iseh:tdi:ng the public right of •.y.ay adjacent te 
the prepefty, sllaH ae Jtept free ffom weeeg or plant gr-ewth in ex:eess often (10) i!M!hes 
(2S4 mm). Weeds shaH be defined as an grasses, annual plants aRd vegetation other than 
trees or sh.--ubs; provided. however, this t@ffR shall eot iReh1de ealtivated flo1NeFS aoo 
gafdens. k shall be the duty of any: per-sea ewRiRg, leasiRg) oeeYf}ying) or e0etF0Hieg aey 
plat of groHRd iR teejl:HisElie,ion lo 13re•1ent tfle gFOWth of weeds theFeOn. lft.•1eeE!s iR 
ex:eess of.re& O 0) i-Aehes (2$4 mm� are not etit ·nit-hie U'l:e time 5JJ@eiHeEI iR a eotiee Of 

eFaeF 10 dose, tee City mtt;t, iR ifs sole dioerelien, and in Mditioo oo atl.3/ ether r,emeeies 
pre•t'i.eed fer in. this eoeel eoose �he weeds te ee e\Jt ftft� eharge EJiie east theFeef te me 
r,rep,eft;' ewtter. opel'tlter aind/!or oeeuf!)aflt. The eest aAEI eKr,E!flses inettlent te the e\!Ulflg 
of weeds shall eeeome 11s a taK lieA ag&tflst the 13,operty ftft6 shall be eeHee�ee in the sflffle 
manner as ta,i. . " 

Section PAI 303. 4.1 is added to read a5 fellows: 

''J2M 3B3.4 . .' PrtJHHtg-' AH wees, bttsnes, keeges) shrubs) ·Jines anti ether 13lat1t 
gre•nth SDall be 1Ee1Jt pmoed so es ftet te: eesttuet the •,1isioA ofopemtoFS ef vehieles 
tftweling \fl'0ft 883/ r,tthUe siweet, fO&d Of mgh�•,ay; e8ft5t:i�ttte ft ha2ftrtl f&•;ehiettlar-Of 
(:ledest-rian Eraffie; be hamt'de�s le the ptthlie health aatl welfa:re; er o�e,w1se ee11stitttte a 
ElekimCfl:t te the e.eighhefhood� or eirtist in violation of aey other code or ordinanee of the 
� 

&elio,t PM Jrn. 7-. l is aElded t;o reeti 6f.l fellows: 

"P/tf.. 303. 7.} R:ehlifff,rg Wal./: Ret&ift'.ing walls er tlre&way wa:Hs lu1NiAg a rveffieaJ 
Mef:)-efmore t:kaa tlMfty (38),-1:nehes &om one (I) aEijaeent elevatioA to ooother shall ha>1e 
a guafflrajJ meeti11.g the requirements of tl:re CABO ORe an.d Two Family Dwelling Code 
refereHeed in €hapter 8 at the top of the wall. &.iery gt1ardmil shall be firmly fasteHed 
and eapable of bearing nomutlly imposed loads-wul sludl.--ee-matntained iR-gooe 
eotulitioa." 

8ec#eH PM 3(}3. 7-.2 is aetteti to reatl M fellows: 

"PM J.()3-:-?-d Dtlnge,veu9=:fe,teea: Fenees on resideetiel use properties ·.vhicl\ i.nelude 
baroed ·.vire or en el.eetrieal euffeH:t shall be eoasfdered dangerot:lS end a pubhe nuisance 
afld ai:e prohiai,� ... 

See,<kJ" PM ,03.8 is affleadeti •o Fea4 es fello� 

128 



ORDINANCE NO. 06-24 

"PM 303.8.�lel<Jf 1-chieks: Motor vehicles shaU be subjeGt to the following 
reEfUirements of Seetioes PM 30t.8.l, PM 301.8.2 a0El PM 301.8.3!' 

Seet.ioH PM )91-.8 . .1 is adderd te i:eae as fellows: 

"PA{ J.QJ. 8. ! J2erlfi.•ft:·: All meter ¥81\i&les shall he t)arked iR appFev-eet off Smilit 
f)OHEiRg arNS or on on tfflf)f0Ved street. Th@JJarking or eriving of motor vehiel8S o'/er 
eu.r-bs, sidewalks, yaMs, eoons, plantiRg a,:eas or odu,r plaees not inlended fur •1ehieuler 
ffilffie is prehieited." 

SeelioA PM 303.8.2 is added to read es follows: 

"PM 303.8. 2 Repffir, service er m9mk!HRnee: Toe Fepairiag, sewieing; rep1aeement of 
paltS, er 11:le perfofJf)aAee efJ:aaiftt:eeaAee v;of4E oa a vehiele OR a Jmhlie street or aar 
,-rivete lands or :iuemises is pronfbitetl, eiHl&f)f as pro'Yided oele•N: 

(a) Major repairs may b�perfeRBed �aB. oeGl,lJJaRt ef: the pr-e1Bises-oR--a 1Jehiele
owned hy tfte Oee\tf)ilnt or o&her ee.oopaRt of the JJfemtses in an eneloseEI gar:age.
f)R:11.-ided that etieR Fepairs do not result iR ee,x:ieus odors, R:HHes or Reise, or
eeRSfitu�e atty ether detriment te tile neighborh.eoe. Examples efmajer repairs
are: rep)aeing atransmissien. froat or rear end:; springs, shoeks; valves.pistons,
Fings, earlntr-etor er other Rta,jer p,arlis ofa mater er eegiee; Fef!aiF heay ·Nork
over fifty (SO) pereeRt efthe ·Jehi0le; repainting of mere lhan fifty (SO) fJeroMt
efthe '¥ehlele.

(h➔ Mieor repairs may be JJerfeRBee by aR 0ee11pant efthe premi-B@s on a ¥Miele 
owned ey the oooopatit-or ether eeeupam. ef the premises, preYieerd sooh refJaif 
is pierfeFffied OR er immedia�ely ia weRt efthe p,emises. E,tamples efffliHor 
repairs are: tune-up; Ghaaging ofoil/fiher (pro•lideEI no publie spaee is po1luted 
er Elamaged�; HX1Ag a €lat; A,f)laoteg a bMteF)', hglns/ln:ilbs, bmlces; roiating 
tires; flushi-ng rm.:hater s,"filem. 

(G) The above permitted repairs may be perfonnech provided that they are 
eeffi�leteEI ,, .. m:iie :fi�eeA (I�� days aft.er �heir eommeneemeRt and thereafter d�e 
¥ehiele Yp,oR \\<hieh the repaiFB are made is l•Uy 0130f'able upen aay p1:1bli0
sh=@� er high11,r.ay; atul fl.u1her JmPrided Qlat net mOFe thaa fet:tr (4) �ir
periods of fifteen (15} days er less oceur on ar in froRt afany gh1en premises
within oRe-(1) year."

SelN-iBH PM 3(J.lS.3 is addee ta read as felle1n•s: 

11PM J(}.J. &. J <hiNk 1iehiele.i: No jlulk >Jeh.iele shall he kept or main�aieed� @9l.aept in 
aR area lav.rful1y lieensee as a jHr.kyard. 11 

Seelien PM 303.8.4 is added to read as follews: 

!'J>M 303. B. 4 UnlieeMed -.'ellieles: Wot met=e tk-ae one (I) SYrrl!Rtly ualieeMee moior 
vekiele shall l:te flarked aft a:ey t3F8perty ifl a r-esideHtial zene, am sueh •1ehiele sha-11 .Roi at 
MY time be ill a state of major disassembly or disrepair, nor in the process of being 
strip pea-or-dismantled. 11 

SeeiioH PM 300. 9 is aEIEltlfl ,o read es follows: 

129 



ORDINANCE NO. Q6.24 

"PM 303. 9 SUJfflge �&Juipmenl; 8oats, tmile£S, eampeFB, vans eee. �eFe&tienel 
Yehieles shall. \1e ster-ed in aeoortiMce with me follo•uing sequenee of parking 
tweilaeili�: �&) eehind tile front euilding Hne, en oft ai,pfe'"ee smfeee; (h) in the 
tlri'ie'Nay whieh is eonsmte!ed of er,pf0¥ea materia:ls as Fet:}Wfetl hy Chapter 25 eftke 
Rockville CityCode entitled "Zonieg and Phmning." 

See1itm P-M J�.}0 is aedee te reoel as feH0"+11S:

J!./'Af-- 393. J(} PHblic nuistmee: All interior Md e,i,terier property area and e,remises 
sha:11 ee mamtaiHed seas fo pre•rtmt the et=eMien ef Ofty p�lie nttisooee as defined m this 
OOEle:,!! 

Se-e1i0H PM 3(J3. U is aedeEI fo read as feU01
•
1;s: 

"PM- 593. !1 Abttntf.ofted 1•e.frige1-ttf<J,•s: No ieeee:,e, refrigemfof, ffeezet=, er othe, 
large airaght eeflta:iner, whieh is ne let1ger used fer refrigemtioR purposes, shaU he 
plaeee, kept; stored er diseMeee on Elt'IY puhlie or prit;at,e pFOperty WJthout l.he a .. aeheE:t 
doors, hinges; locks or )a*ehes being first remo·,ed.,. 

Set#i6H PU J{}J.12 is aedee �o feOEI as feU01+1.1s: 

!'FM 3W . .'2 Ottfdoe,· #Jumt,,�t'8n: l', �roefl ffi&y ROt OJ:}erete &fto/ eutdeer Mfifiei&l 
ilkim.iftftHMl ee·1iee en pri•1afe f:IFeperty ift SlieB a fflftftAer as to iafetfere •Jlitft the �e or 
eftjoymettt efa.bt:Uting or Heftf8Y pFepetty." 

Seelimi P.l,,J 303.13 is added to reoo as fellows: 

''PM 393. H V:ehie!esfor !ttthiktlietm p,stJ!t;bit-ctl: Ji-le tFEl:iler, reereeUen •1ehiele, ear or 
eruek sha:ll he eFOught 1Nitltie the eorporote limits of the City for die purpose of h.e'bhatien 
ane Ei'NeHiA.g thefein fe, a peried of more tftM: twe,uy fa'l:H' kettfs." 

�i@,'f P-U llH.11 is addee te read as feU0•+1.1s,: 

''PM 103 . .' 4 Gkan.'-iftess r,{Cily Yi-ght tef-•,wty: Ne &eoopMt or 01/ifler ef BftY 
dwelling, tl"+¥elliflg �it, or i,ropet-1y berdet'ing any sweet; aUey, or fight of way, skail­
dei,ostt gafh.age, reruse er rahbish into the right ef W&?J, street, er all�· M>ttlliAg the 
JJFetRJ ses." 

Seefi6N P-U J(U.3 is ameeeee as fellows: 

"PM 394.3 8Hoeel nflfflhenn 

(1) It shall he the responsibility of the owner of Et.HY single family detached or 
aUaehed residential skueture to eisplay, faomg &he fNat lat line, mtmei:als at 
least three (3) inehes in height desfgnetie-g the address assigned ta the structure 
by the Cit-y. It shell be tho respoR&ibility of tho ewBeF efeny aemmereiel, 
inElust:fial BfiEI multi family HSiEleatial stRil:EMUH ta Elisplay, feeing tlte ffORt lot 
line aad et all entrooees faeing p�cing eire85, numerals el least siK (6) inehes iR 
height aesignedttg the aeaHss asstgHed to t:he stA1et\lff lly the City. 

(2) All address displays sh.all be rested on eontrastiftg baekgrt)1:md displayed in e 
eeRspiettaus piaoo amJ in a ma.1mer as to be elearly visible from the nearest 
street, eMJept that displays required at entrances fueing parking areas shaU be 

l30 



ORDINANCE NO. 06-24 

elearly visihle frt:Jm sooh parking areas. When a structure has me,e thtm e1u, ( J) 
address,, m:tmeFals shaH he tlsed to designate me aedFess in sequence." 

See#en PM 304. 7 is amendea �e reat1 as follows: 

1tpM 304. 7 Roofe ettd dreinege: Th:e roof aeti flashie-g skaH he souAe, liget, aed not 
h�e deteets •nhfoh might admit Faia. R:oofdraiaage shoH he adequate to pnweet 
dampness or detenorat:ion iR the waUs er iateriot' pertioR of the b�ilding. Roof water shall 
ROI be tlisooaFgeG OAte aA. aeutting or adjaeent property. tt 

See#� PM J.04.7.! is added to Feed as follm¥s: 

!'FAl 3(/4. 7. l Gut-le-."6, dowN6fJOUUi and ople&hhleeks: AH Eoofs of a-11 buildings, 
Y-DleBs the roof o¥errumg eMeeeds tweaty fow: (2 4 )➔nehes, shall ha¥@ gytleFS, eo•NR&J)O wts 
and splashbloee instaJled in ae apfffoYed mar.Ber and maintairu9d ueobstrusted aea in. 
goad repair seas ta assist in property stenn drainage." 

See�1t PM J04. !fl is deletee. 

$ee#9n PM 304. 13 is i:llrulflded to read as follo,.•t's: 
11.PM J.94.lJ lltmtlrsih t1Hti�s,"liHils: lwer)r f-light ofsta-irs •w•hieh is three or IBEIM 

risers high sha-11 have a handrail on at least one tJ} side ef the stair, a.Rd �ery o�eR 
peFtioR of a �air, laAdrng OF balooR¥ •,11hioh is more than thirty (30} inches (762 mm) 
abo\re lhe floor oF grade below shall ruwe guardroiJs. R:ett1:ti� haRdrails aeti g�ls 
shaU meet the re{j_uiremeets set forth ie the Building Cofle and One and 1\¥0 family 
Dwelling Code ret'eFenced in Chapter 8. 8:1tisting k-aadrails a"d gti�udFail!:.1 wh.iehd� 
meet t�e spe8ifie ffEtUifemenlS ei-these oodest and which are deemed by the b1;1ildiflg 
official ts be safe, may rwn&in in plaee ,...,jt;ke� aheratioA. g,;ery llanQFQ.il and guardrail 
shall be fiAHly fastened, maintained in gooEI ooooition, &Mt 6apahle ofo011rieg AormaHy 
imposed loads." 

Seelion PAI 304.15 is amenEled to reae as ffiHo:v;s: 

"PM 304.15 !nseet sereMS: Every doer, wind-Ow and ether emside opeaieg ttsed or 
re(tYiMEl :fer ¥emilation pYfP'OSes seFviag any OOffdj.ag eootaining habitable rooms, food 
�aFation arfis, f.ood s�s. er a:ey aMas v,h@Fe proGl!EilS yses iA foes feF human 
�1:tmptiee aFe pFoeesset4, manumetured., package,Et or st0Fed, sh.all he SUf)f:l'lieel widt 
appro>Jetl tightly fitting seFeens of= not less thim J e mesh per iRGh 1md e'lef)' 8'.¥in.ging 
aeeF shall-ha',le a seU closing Eleviee ia good ·Norking oomiitfon. Ex.septien: Sereen aoors 
skall Aot he requiF&d mr Ollt swieging d0011& or etBer t!,'f)es of.openings which make 
s8fetmings impraotiilal, fJ'r<PFidee ether Gf3fJl'87led Hleflns, sooh as air oortains OF iRBeGt 
,epetlaRt fans are empleyed. '' 

See#9N PAI 3()4. 16. l is aeeled to F&ael as feUe,.•;s: 

"PM 694. J& . .1 DeRd/,eeks a,uJ deadbe"5: B'lery O'.'Ater al'Mllor operator shall suf!ply 
and install on &\<ery e�dtv.ia-y doer whieh serves as Ml entraftee tfoor to M individual 
Elwemeg anit a ¥iffieal belt EleaElleek er a 4ea.4beh •ui&k at least a one-half.ineh. mro•N . 
.SWh. deadeelt &Bd deadl&teh shaU be eftf'able af beiRg: Joek.ed aAe 1:tRJoeked with a key or 
keys from oYlside the dweUiRg unit. ,'\hefBale Eteviees of equal feNe may he s1:1hstiwt0Ei 
at the disefetien efdle eode offi&ial. EH.it deofS shall tie eafJable efheing opened from the 

13 l 



ORDINANCE NO. 06·24 

ie!.lide witheut d:i.e ooe ef e. key, e*eept es 13m¥ieed fer iR the h!:iileiag eeElo listee ia 
Chapter 8 ... 

Section PM 304.!9 is added to read as feUe•H&: 

"PM 3Q4.J9 Arooweypro1ee#tn'l: All wineew wells, MEefief d00F epeRiRgs, 
r,'ffltiletiens, aad aeeeos opening arew+¥ey8 o•ter tweHty fe1:1F (24) inehes iR 1,10Aieel depth 
Wow adjaeertt g,oood level shall be provided with e. hori2:ental gtille, •;eflieal Failieg 
thirty (30) iaeh� ifl heig-hf er other af>PFO't'od ru•oleetiee. AU grilles, railings eee 
etwerings shall "he fiffflly fos�eneti tffl.ti ea,al,le ef bearittg ttofftW)y impetiee loe.ds C1:Bd 
sit-all he maiRtaifl� in geed eeaEHaea. 11 

Seeli<JH. l'M 3(}5.7 i-s amended to read as follows: 

"PM 3 05. ;z Hu,.,J,.a;/a RHd g-Na-r.Jrai/3; B•rery A:ight ef steirs \\4:itelt is lkt:ee Of mare 
FiseFS high sh:a:IJ hw,e a lttlfldrail en at least one (1) side efthe stair, tmd e•rery epeA 
portfon: of a Sffl:ir, landing or haleony 1Nhieh is more thM t:hitty (3Q) inehes (762: mm) 
al:,o•,·e the floor or !!:ffide l,elow shall tuwe gttMEl:r-ails. R:eqttired hafldfflils Md gwwtlre.ils 
shall meet the requirements set forth in the Bttfldtflg Ceee afld One aftS. Two family 
Dwelliag Code refereReed in Chapter S. Blll.isting handrails anEl gtumlf&ils whiett do Aet 
meet the speeifie reqt:1irements ofthese eodes aeEI whien-a-re Eleemeel by the buileiA:g 
effieie,l ta be safe. � FeFBaie iR �laee witheHt elteratiofl. EYer}' handrail and guMdrail 
sheH ee RFtDly festeeeel, meiAte:ieed ia geed eef'I.ElitieR; eRd eapehle of bearing :Aomtally 
imposed I oaEls. 1't 

&eJif:JnPM- 3(}5.8 is aflded te reae as fello•Ns! 
11..0AI 1 {)J. S lmerier doora and hardware: E¥ery bedroom and bathroom -shall ho,,e a 

Eleor whieh f1F01Ades p,i,.,e�. This deer sha.U be meint-ained in good eomJitioR tmd have a 
doer Jat:eh Of ether 1oelaeg de•Aee that is opemhle e:Ad under the control of the oee-Hpant 
se that i,fr10ey is R;ointainetl 'Ni�in sueh reom." 

&et-i<Jn P!tf.. 305.9 is a.tided �e read es feHews! 

'
1PM 1,{)§..9 &,th�'-BBfft atfti .'elehe,if,wnishhr-g�: E·.-ery stipplied bathroom and kiteheH 

erawer, ceeiset, shelf, aeEI. ·.r.anity shall he main�a�eee iR a s11fe;-50Uftd, and iH geed repair 
with 8f'f'1'€1f'R&te harelwar-e. tt 

Seetiof't'PM 395. !O is eddeEI te FeaEI es felle•m:-

"PM 3{}5.10 &l#tfflom £1ntl-kilehenjle0f!J: Everf toilet, bathroom and kitehen Aoor 
51:1ffaee shall be eoflfitAie&ed ane FR6ietaiaeEI sa as 1'0 be 51:lhslaRt-ieHy impervious-to water 
&Rd sa as to fll:!RHit s1:1eh flaoF la he easil,r kept it1 a clean 1md saruta.ry eondition." 

&e."ion PM 30-5 . .'l is added te read as f.ellows: 

"P.M- 305. n Preefrem dampness: Geilaf!f-, 1'asemenis an.6 eFa·.•A spaees in e·1e,y 
haileiag shaU be ma.iBtained ffee from steRElin-g water, and reasonably free from 
�aess." 

See#,m PAI 30§.12 is atideti te read as feUeWtn 

"f'J,f. J{)5.l2 CleanNnesa: Every oeeuptlftt ofa struetttr-e or p,Mt fhefeefshftU keep 
that fJBl't afthe stRJetlilre or premises thereof whieh he oee1:1pies, eonk=Ols oMt:Ses, in-a 

132 



ORDINANCE NO. 06-24 

e.leaR aR.ti &aRitary oonditien. Ei.1ery evmer and/or operator ofa d·.•<'elling eoafaiaiag �we 
(2) or moH Eli.¥eUing units shall maiRlaiR ie. a elea0 and saei�ary oenaitien the shafed or
1:1oolie areas ef lhe ewelling�oo premises th@feef)!

SeetioH PA( J.(}5_ .<J Ni added to read-as follows: 

"PM J9§. !3 Sttpphed/lXI� al'ld etfN�I.' The o\vner, operater or ose1tp8ftt of a 
strnsture or part thereof shall keep the supplied. equipmeat lfflfil fixmres therein eleaR and 
sa-Ritar?;; aDEI skaH he respoosiblefer the ex.ereise of.reasonable eare in their preper \¼Se 
aRe O_f'eratioA. u 

Seetien PAI 305.!4 is added te read as foUe•.,;s: 

"PM 305.} 4 FHrnis,fied by 0eeupant: The eqtJipmem aed fi:ltR:!fe5 fumisl:aeEl h¥ the 
eeettf!aRt efa struet:are shall be preflerly iRsfaHSEt, aad shaU be maiRtained in good 
working oondition, kept clean and sanitary,-and free ofElefeets, leaks, er oestruet:iens.tt 

SeelieH PM J().5. J5 is addee taread as fel� 

ff PA( 3(M . .'5 SaHilaFJ,' msiHteHMee: E,,ie,y OGGYpaat of a dwelling or <PNelling unit shall 
keep in.a dean ani:I sartita1y 00aditoi0n that pa:Ft efthe EP,YelliRg or dwelliAg Y:Rit aREl me 
preM:ises the,eof:i.,<hteh. he 0eeyt:1ies aed eenkals. A eleaR enEI sanitafY eendition shall 
include batis not limited to the foUowing stffldarEis; 

u(a) P:loOFS, t1oor--ee-veri0gs and other v,•alkiag st1Ffaees shall be kE,ft eleaA and he 
efdift:., tihh, gattage, hum(u.1 aRci antmal ,,,;astes, Huer, ref:use ane any ethef 
losamtary matter." 

"(b➔ WaUs, oeilings. wit1d01J•,<9 and doemia;is shall he kept elean eml i:ee4eirt, 
greasy filfflt soet aiad aay edter insaAitary maM-er. ,; 

"(e➔ PlumbiRg HJHl:H"e§ shall he k0ft in a elean Md sa0itary GORaitioni ae4 A0 
m:elMial shall he de,esiled in any-soo:h fixture •nbi0hmay FeSult ie the 
ef:lslnle�ion of saoh J.ixhwe or ofaay lines eotmeeteti dur,re,e. every oeellfMHH' 
shall be respensible for the exeroise ofreasenable care in the proper \¼Se and 
oi,eratioR taereof." 

''{d) Heetls Md. �uets evef kitelten raages shaJI ae eleaneEI hy the oeeupan:t at least 
tvtiGe eaeh year of grease andot;ner flammable materials that collect therein." 

Seed9H PM 3O6.J.} is deleted. 

Seetien PM JO&.J . .2 is ameREleEi 10 r.ead as fellows: 

"PM 30�.J.2 Celffflif,c,,s: The owAeF er operator ef e,-;ery preperty proEhioing 
garbage shall pro•1ide in suffieient quantitiest and at all times cause to be used, )eakpt=eef 
aJJpro•.•eEI eoakliaers p18viEleEi with eiesefiMiag ee¥ef5 for tee sto�of sool¼-materiaJs 
uRtilremovetl &am the premises for dit,pesa . " 

Secl-i0n PM 3Ge. 4 is added te read as foUo·.•.rs: 

!'PM 306. 4 Gs,=l,ege. n,thbisl, aNI ashes: For e¥ery m:JildiRg eontiaiAiA.g tftfee (3) or 
moFe d1Nellin,g HflilB, the 0•.•;ner aeeler eperalor shall proYide, in a ioeahoe�eessible to 
aU eweUiRg ,mil5, an aeeEfwate numeer ef ree9l't:aeles iRte whieh gafbage. R:10bish aed 
ashes from the dweUing unit reeeptaoJes may be emptied for storage between the days of 

133 



ORDINANCE NO. 06-24 

eeUeet:.iaa. Reeeptaeles shall he made of metal, he watertight and pro,,,ided ·.·1ith hMEHes 
eR4 tight e0•1eFs. Chates feF d\e eow;�aeee ofgarhege other than to eB appro:Yed 
iaeiReFatoF are pF0hihi1eE1.1t 

Seelton-PM 307d is ameaded as fellews: 

up).{ J07.2 Onwe.v: The o::r.vfieJ Elfttil.of opet'etof of any struemre shall be respen:s-ihle 
fi.3r e1dOFmisatioR witJ.lin dte stn:letaFe prior to rentiag. lee:Sifig er selliag the sf:R:lefttre. 11 

&eet-io"' P·U 3-97.5 is amended es fellews: 

11PM J07.5 OeelipaH-1: The-eeeupant of any struetuFe shall be responsible fer 
m&imeiniRg the-struemre and eKterior aFeas in a elean and sanitary eondition so aHet ·fe 
pFe•liee fer kar-borege ef or iR-feffi�ea by FeeeAls." 

Section PU 397.6 is addett as fello'+¥S: 

J/PM 307.6 Conlinued mde�t ir.fetJUl#tffl: ContinwRg OF repeatet:i iftciElent:s ef r-eElertt 
iRfestatieR shaU ffKiUiFe t-he iestaHation of ratproof and •rerminproof walls, floor or other 
bamefS. R:aqueef: ood 'leFFlli:Aflroof hemers shall be installed in aeeordanee with the 
8ui1Eltng Ceee listee iH CkepteF g oftkis P:FOpert,' Main�@flQftEl8 Coee,!! 

See#oH PU 49/.} is amendee � Feae as foU0•115: 

"PM 401.1-R:e.ipen9ihUity: The owner and/or operator of the sm.tetttre shall pro11ide 
aee ma:in&ein light. vet1tilatioR and space conditions in eomplianee with. these 
r�:iff!FBBMs. A peP.laR shaU aot oeeupy as owner oeeupeRt or pem1:it another persoR to 
ee<.m� Of use Bil)' s81!€i1::tre or portion tMeof er pH!mises wh.ieh eees eot eemply •♦-Jith 
the follo½<tflg: reqw,em:tu'lts ef tht5 artfole." 

Section PU 405. /() is amended to read as felle·.•.•s,: 

"PM 4(M. UJ �%-etlfJ,'¥IptwtdioM: AH �aees t'lsed or i1HeR.0ee to be t:1sed faF feae 
preparatieA shall eontaiA suitable spa:eo and equipmeRt �e store, prefHH:e end seF¥e feoes 
in a s8flitM}' m1umer. Thet'e shall be adequate ffl:eilities ana serfiees ier lhe SfHiitary 

dispesol ef feed was•es 1md refuse, ineluding taeiliti es � r temperery st:orage whe.r-e 
neeessftf}'." 

8ee1ion PM 501. 2 is ameAded to read as-foHows: 

"PAf SO.'.J SetipoH1Jieili1y: The 0•+¥ner aMYer O('erater ofth,e slnletare skaU f.lFO'Yide 
and mainmtn �eh ,h1m.\:iing fueilities aR4 ff;l(htFes in eelftf)liaeee with these requirestenls. 
A persott sh:ftll net eeeupy as owner oee\fJ)ant er Ju:,rmit Ml6tfter t)efflefl to oee\tf'Y or use 
MY struetlft'e er portion the,eof or l)fefflises ·whieh tloes aot eomply v1it,h the followiag 
r-e(tUi:reffteAe e f this affi el e." 

See1ion PM-$06.5 is added as follows: 

"PA.f. §9&.5 P,"V!Jtccfft>H: WheN the heating faeHiries of rut;c ewelling &r d•ne1Hng WRit 
tlfe llH�ef the eoHft'Ol of the ee�pant theFeef, it �au be tke respe0sieility ef tlte eeeupaat 
te E)J:lemte the lieMiRg faeilities ie efeer te mainlain above freeang tempffilftjres iit an 
times in all pertions of the EJwelling or {j•l'Jelliag unit MEI t:he J)fefflises the,eef wltieh he er 
she oeeupies and eonlrols so as te pre\'eftt in;j� &f etunage 10 wafer pipes Mtd 
ph;imhing. 11 

134 



ORDINANCE NO. 06-24 

Seeliel'l PM 50:Z.J is eddeEI lo reaEi as feUo:i.v-s: 

"PM 507.3 Ensling we.'/ and seplic syslems: AU Misting well and se13lio systems 
snail be maiBtaie&EI iR geoEI oper.atiAg Gef\dition, UpeR failure of the Sef)�ie sys�em, tee 
e-wt1er or 0eeu,1ult shall 7,rlKlaffl tlte �uilEling or oo� io t�e pwliG water and se,,Ner 
sys�em." 

Seef.ie� PM SQ.S. l is arae™:telSI to-read as follows; 

"PM 508. J Gei1e-ffll: Draiaage of FOefs aael J1a>,rea areas, :,ams aoo eourts.; aRd other 
epen. areas on. the premises shall not be dischargetl itt a mfff'.nef d:iat orea&es a poblio 
nuu;aooe er eaeses eireot water flow aGF0ss er OR to an abutting or adjaeeflt prop eR}'. JI 

Secli0fl PM (,0!.2 is amended •o reatl as follows: 

"PM �}.2 Resp01t.Sieiliiy: The 01Nner an8fer opeFater oflhe slmGtw:e shall pro¥ide 
aR4 maiRta.ift 9'tleh meehanieal anEI eleeeieal faeit.ilies and e1:t:Yipmem in eoRtpliaeoe w:iik 
these requirements. A person shall not oeeupy as o•,YRer oeelfl'aAt or J)@RHit -eealher 
f@FS0n to eoo� or use any strusture or portion thereof on premises -.,,rhjeh tiees not 
OOR'lpl:, with the followiAg feeilii�eAts oft:his artiele, ,. 

See1i0n PAI 602.2 is amended to reatl as follows: 

!ff'.•.,J 6Q.2.2 ResideHdal bftildiHgB: Jh,ery oweer or opeffllor ofoof Skl:IGhn·� who 
reftt5, 1ease6, or le�s oRe ( l) or mot=e av,eHi0g uRits shall supply s:yffieieet heat to the 
ocoo.pants thereof dwing the peri&d from Oetober l to M� l S �o maiRlaie a FOom 
tefAp�ure efnot less tkaR siK43/-fwe-(6�-0egrees F. ( 18 degrees C.) iA all habiEallle 
spaees, hadtroems, aRd toilet-meRlS �YRAg the lieliro bew,ceeA: 6:3Q a.m. aR<l-10:30 p.m. 
of eaeh day, am:1 maiataia a tempemture &fnet less than sixty (60) degi=ees J.:. (I 6 dega:ees 
C.) during other hours. The tempe,a�are shalt l:,e measuretl at a point three O) feet (914 
mm) aaove tke flooF--and three (J) feet (914 mm) from the eKteriof \val Is. 8,<;eeptio0:
When. the eKterior temperoture falls helot.•+< Zet'O � Eleg,:ees F. (48 degrees C.) and the
heatiag s;cstem is operatiRg at its fuH eapaoity, a miaimum room temper-at,ure of si*lY (60�
degrees P. ( I 6 tleg,ees C.) skall l=,e mataraiRee at all itmes. 11 

&!elien PM 60LJ is ameR<:led to read as fellov,•s: 

"PM 6()2.3 N<mresiden#a[Sl,"Uet-urea. J3yery enelesed e&oapied werk spaee !ihaU be 
swptJlied ·nidl syffioieR+-heat dUfiRg tk�period from Oetober 1 through May IS �e 
mairaat1ra temperah'IFe ofR0t less thaR e.S El&gFees F ( 18 degrees C.) auring all working 
OOYfS.

11 

ExeeplitHt6: 1. PFoc.essing storage and operation areas that require eeoling Of s,eoial 
temperatuH eendiiions; 

Z?. Areas in whieh·f)eFSORS are primarity engaged in ·Agofous ph)isieal aewl'iti� 

See#oH PM 6{}J.j is 11meaded to read as feHo•ll's: 

"PAI 6()3.3 Ceelung and heating eqt:tipme,,.t: AH eooking and heating e11aipmem:, 
eampeaenH� and aeoesseries iR every heating. cook�ng at1d •.•.rater heating devi:ee shaH ee 
maintain� fFee from leaks aae ot.sfruetioas, and kept funationiAg fJJOperly so as to be 
fF@e mHn HFe, health, anti eeeielent �aros. AU instaUatiens anEI repairs shall he made in 
aeeoffianee •1,citft tke pFeYisiens efihe e1:1iltliRg ooEle, ef ether la•Ns or ordinaF10e8 

135 



ORDINANCE NO. 06-24 

Bflf)lteflt'Je tfterefo. PoFtehle eoelcing eEJ\lipment is p,ekieit:ee. e*e@f't feF apJJF01retl 
fe5i deB:aal t;rt,e feed trays or sal•,1eFS which are heated hr e e11edle er alee he I lamp." 

Seet-i<Jn PM 6()3.3. l is added to reed as fol1EWl9f 

''PM (>()3.J. ! Ref;<ige.;,,afiolf: lweFY d•1,ienisg 1:1nit shell eeAle.iR a ref-rigeratioR lfflit 
�CE)ttate for tile lempe,ary preservatieA ofperisheele feeds. SYeh e 1:1Rit shell he eepa-ble 
of matniruftieg an a•,.emge teffli,erattire below fony ft•Je (45) deg,ees Fahfeftfteit� and 
sh&II he J'FefltffiY insta:Uefl, opemted 8f.tEI ma-infflined� amt skell be kept itt e eleoe aed 
sanjtary-eonditieA." 

See#6H PAI (i.QJ.9 is aede4 to read-ils foHCY#S:

"PM &fH.9 Cl-ir11ttte ee,ur,el: When ftleHmes fer imerier eHmale oetHFel {heatiRg, 
eeeling, andfer h.ttm:itiity) ewe integrel Nt1etioru1 efstraeturetJ used as. d•.•,•enieg 1:1eits or 
other oeeupaneies, Stien f&eiHties shall ee ma-inteoinee and eper,a•ed in e eentirn1ous 
manner in aoooFdanee with the designed eapeeity." 

See#0H P·M 605.2 is ameRded le HlMJ es feHwws-: 

"PM M)S.2 R:eeqntieks: E·.•ery heeita\lle 5fleee in a &welliag sktill een�aie. at least 
t'No separate MEI femote ,eeepmele eut:lets. Every Jaumhy a,ea sMH eotttain et least 0M 
( l) grouHded type �ptaele. E·,ery hethfeom ske.11 eenhtifl M least one (I) reeeptaele
protected by a ground fau!HnterNpter eireuit.''

Seel/on P,A{ 60�. t is ameedeEI lo Had es rono,ws.: 

"PA.f. 6()6.1 Geneffll: Ble1t'fttef5; dtufl\,wo.tters eee eseahltoFS shell he Mainmiaed &o 
sastain safely all imi,osed leads, te ei,emte properly Md in eomplienee with all State 
regulations, and te ae free ff'Offl physieal aa.d ftr-e heer� 

&eli0n Pl,{ 7.fU.1 is ameedeEt lo reed es foll01,¥s: 

"P:M 7-fJ.'.2 lwsfJ6HSibUi,ty: The &'Nfter ftftf:i,(er o"eF&tcr of l,M stftletYM shaU pFo:r,,iee 
and ma:intaiR sueh fire sef.ety faeilities and e�ipment in e&Htphaaee v,rill\ the 
F@<iUiFemeRts efthe fire eode. A persoo shell 0-et oeoop'.)I as Ot,'lftCf Oeeti\9ftftt er peffflit 
anethef person to oeeupy or liSe any stmetttre or pert thereef or J:lFCfllises -.vhteh does not 
eomr,ly wilh the foUewiag requi,emems of this artiele." 

&etien PM 1()2.) is ee1eh!d. 

Seeli0n PM 702.5.1 is aEldeEI es foUews: 

"PM UJJ.5.1 Ns#fieaUeH ojeJeil!J: It shall be the responsibilit.)1 ef the 6'NftCf, eF ftis 
epeMtor er &geflt, lo eolify lho oeOHpalH of Hie 19essageway to all required e:idts,. exeept ifl 
Htose hofels or motels where a seale Aoor plaR eflhe passag&1,','8:)'S and-eK1ts is posted in 
eaehroom." 

Seelien PM- 702.6 is a.mend� to reed as fellows: 

''PM UJ-2. & Cs,"+'itfe,v t.'-,•te/.saur,e: ,'\ll eoFridors serving aR oeeupant load gt=eeter Ulen 
tkirty (30) 8ftd the eponiag tfiet'eiR shall r,ro¥ie.e aa e#eeti:r,ce barrie1 to resist the 
me•,remOflt efsm.elte. AH ff'aftsems, lou,,rers,, doofS aRd other epeniegs shall be elosed or 
SM:H "he self elosing, eMeept es may be pefffiiMed b� the BuHdiR:g CeEte hs4eEI i11-{;hepler 
� 

136 



ORDINANCE NO. 06-24 

See#on PM 7-0J. 7 is EHHeaded to read as feHo'\vs: 

"P.M 7-().2_ 7 l>ead end-#evel di-sta,we: All som..ter-s that serve mere than one { 1) eH:,it 
sh.all f1re¥ide EliRetooDHeetien ta s1:1eh eMkl. The length efa dead Ed eeRieor sJtan Rot 
HeeeEI that pe.RniueEI h:',' lhe BoHdiAg Code list� iR Ghaf!ter 8. 11 

See#oR PM 'l-f;;J.9 is ameooed to read as feUo,,•,cs: 

"PM 7-02 .. 9 S.tain�. hc1Hd,aih a,uJgN8l¥h: e•,rery e>t�erior m:1d ifl�erior flight of 
stairs having three or more risers shall haJ,•e a handrail, and e•lery open portion ofa stair; 
landing or haleony v;hioh is more thaA :rn inehes aho1re 1he floor or grade helow shall 
haYe guares. HaReFails shal1 he nel less t:haR JO-inehes aor more than 4J ieehes high; 
measur,ed vertieaUy abe•,e the oo.slng of the tread or abo:Ye the finished floor e:fthe 
landing er walkiRg sttrfaees. GaardsshaU aot he Jess �an 36 ieehes high abo•,e the f.loor 
of the landing on the balcony, poroh. deck or other wa-lkiAig surfases." 

Seeli<Hl PM 7().2_ !2 is ameRded to read as follo-.vs: 

ffPM 'UB . .'J El'He,ge19e;· 06eef9e: awry sle�ing F00m JaGated in a hasemeAl shall have at 
least ene (I) OfHMlBlhle wineaw eonfemung 10 lfte f.eUmv4ng F@EtuiremeRtsf 

I. Windov.i sil1 height no greater than ferty feur �44) inGhes fr-em the inferior floor
KRmeeliate1y hel0v,r it�

2. WiRdo•N mt1St not-epea-into atl e1tterioF window wen less tlum tluee feet W'-ic,le
JBeasUFee peff)esdieular 10 tdle w:ht4ow glass;

3. WiRdow fR1;:1st l•uwe a ffliRtmut1t RIM elear openiA:g of five ($) sl¥:iare feet, •Nila a
minimum clear opening height of twenty row= (24) inch.es aoo a mini1m1m elear
'.%'iath Elimension ef tv,ieaty inehes.

ht Heu ofa window ·.1rhieh mee*s the fett�ifeffleats aho"i'e, s1:1eh reom ma;• haYe ae 
eKterior door approved for emergency egress or reseue, or shaU ha-i;e aGcess to not less 
tl:laa two ap�ro,,ied iRdepenlileA.t ex.its, 

eX:CePTION: 8uildiffgS f.!Eiuii,,ed thre1;1gheYt with. a eomplete aulomatie I-ire 
suppression system." 

SeeUan PM 7().2.JJ is added lo read as follows: 

11PM 7..{)J_ .'J Eme,,gene,· /-ighling: Emergeeey lighting faei.lities for means of egress 
sltaU he pmvided aRd maimaieed ier every buildiR:g Of SlRletl:IF@ ,..,,twre �uiree h:Y me
NfPA IOI Life Safety Code.'' 

See#0ff---PM-..7(}2. 14 is-a4eed to Hae as fell011;s: 

"PM 7-ru. 14 Fi-Ye sefety �WHCHt>HS-" Melels, metels, &):lartmeHt houses, anEI all othef 
resideatia1 oceupaRcies except one afl<l two family d-Nellings; sha11 hiwe a prinlea eepy ef 
fire safety4nstruetions peFltlaAeRtly aed oonspiouously posted in eacll. oooupancy unit and 
at ether loeations as feEtUil'eEI lly lhe Di11isioR of IRSf)eetieR Serviees. The leK-t aRd t)06'iRg 
leeations shaU be subjeet to the approYa1 af the Chief of l'espeetioR. Serviees. '' 

Seelien PM- UJ-2.15 is added to read as follows: 

.!!/'-Al 'JM. 15 AleslMO[egre58: The ooeupam: of any dwetlieg or dweHiag ueit-shaD 
eat ohstruet ie aay m1Hmer any meaes ofegfess &em any f)ertioe of the premises. 11 

137 



ORDINANCE NO. 06-24 

Seentm PAI- 7-95.4 .• ' is ooeeEI to FeaEht9-fe11e .. ,.,,s: 

"PAI 7+J5. 4.} /:,eeeJien: PoRelde fir-e eKti.Bgtiisheffl shall he pro¥ided aoo meintaiMEI 
itt ell &Fe5 feEtSiFea by �e BOCA Bailding Code listed in Chapter 8." 

SeeNtm PM- 7-f}§.5 is amemlee to read as fellows: 

"PM 705. 5 Smoke deteele�w: Smoke Eleteol:ers shaU ee pFa•;ieeEI, installee ORS 
FBaifttaiRee as fH&)' �e HEJHiFed by olheF a�lieahle, legisla�iOR Of or4inftftee:l! 

Sectien PM 705.8 is added to feed as fellows: 
11�D.M 7-05.8 °'her sftltttUh"tis ttpplieabie: Th.is seetioa i-s iB:tee:eed te be ased with at1.d 

sttp�lemented by tlte applicable previsions of the NatieHel Fire PmteetieR-A-ssooiahaA 
Standards Nos. 71 (1982), 72E (1982) eed 74 (1984), vmieh are hefehy ineer,oreted lJy 
refefeeee hereia� ho•Ne•;er, ifthOFe shall be &RY 00-efliet between tltis eede flftEI 81\Y rales 
BREI regeletioM adap�OE'I pHF51;:l&Rt t,h�o 00:d the reree:eneee ste:ooar4s. the J'fe'•'i918ft ef 
this eode shajl ,revatl;ll 

138 



ORDINANCE NO. 06-24 

ARTICLE XIII. EXISTING BUILDING CODE 

DIVISION 1. GENERALLY 

Sec. 5-289. Scope. 

The provisions of this article apply to existing buildings in accordance with the Maryland 
Building Rehabilitation Code (COMAR 09.12.58) and the International Existing Building Code. 

* * *

DIVISION 2. TECHNICAL STANDARDS 

Sec. 5-291. Maryland Building Rehabilitation Code (COMAR 09.12.58). 

The Maryland Building Rehabilitation Code (COMAR 09.12.58) dated March 25, 2019 as 
may be amended from time to time, and as may hereby be amended, is adopted by reference. One 
(I) copy of such publication, as adopted, shall be housed by the Inspection Services Division and
made available for inspection by the public during regular office hours.

Sec. 5-292. Same - Amendments 

The /CC International Existing Building Code, 2021 Edition (IEBC), as incorporated by 
reference and amended in COMAR 09.12.58, is amended in the following respects: 

Section 101.1 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows: 

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Existing Building Code of 
the City o(Rockville, hereinafter referred to as "this code." 

Section 101.6 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows: 

101.6 Appendices. Appendices A and C, and Resource A are adopted as part of 
this code. 

Section 101.2.1 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows: 

101.2.1 Application of fire code. Where work regulated by this code is also 
regulated by the construction reguirements for existing buildings in Chapter 9 of 
the Rockville City Code, such work shall com(?:ly with applicable reguirements in 
both codes. 

Section 102.4.1 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows: 

102.4.1 Conflicts. Where conflicts occur between provisions of this code and 
referenced codes and standards. the most restrictive provisions shall apply. 

Section 102. 6 is added to the IEBC to read as follows: 

102.6 Relation to the Maryland Building Rehabilitation Code. Where conflicts 
occur between provisions of the Maryland Building Rehabilitation Code and this 

139 



ORDINANCE NO. 06-24 

code, the most restrictive provisions shall apply. In all cases, the minimum 
reguirements of the Maryland Building Rehabilitation Code shall be met. 

Sections I 02. 7 is added to the IEBC to read as follows: 

102.7 Relation to the Maryland Accessibility Code. The Maryland 
Accessibility Code (COMAR 09.12.53) is incorporated by reference. Where 
conflicts occur between provisions of the Maryland Accessibility Code and this 
code, the provisions providing the greatest level of access, as determined by the 
Building Official, shall apply. In all cases, the minimum requirements of the 
Maryland Accessibility Code shall be met. 

Section 103 of the IEBC is deleted in its entirety. 

Section I 05. 2 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows: 

105.2 Work exempt from permit. Exemptions from permit reguirements of this 
code shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to be done in any 
manner in violation of the provisions of this code or any other laws or ordinances of 
this jurisdiction. Permits shall not be required for the following: 

1. Building:

1. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar
finish work.

2. Temporary motion picture, television. and theater stage sets and scenery.

3. Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or agricultural purposes.
and not including service systems.

4. Window awnings suoported by an exterior wall of Group R-3 or Groun U
occu1tancies.

5. Nonfixed and movable cases, counters and partitions not over 5 feet
9 inches ( 1753 mm) in height.

2. Electrical:

1. Repairs and maintenance: Minor repair work, including the replacement
of lamps or the connection of approved portable electrical equipment
to approved Qermanently installed receptacles.

2. Radio and television transmitting stations: The provisions of this code
shall not apply to electrical eguipment used for radio and television
transmissions. but do agply to equipment and wiring for power supply, the
installations of towers and antennas.

3. Temporary testing systems: A permit shall not be required for the
installation of any temporary system required for the testing or servicing
of electrical equipment or apparatus.

3. Gas:

1. Portable heating appliance.

140 



ORDINANCE NO. 06-24 

2. Replacement of any minor part that does not alter approval of equipment
or make such equipment unsafe.

4. Mechanical:

I. Portable heating appliance.

2. Portable ventilation equipment.

3. Portable cooling unit.

4. Steam. hot or chilled water piping within any heating or cooling
equipment regulated by this code.

5. Replacement of any part that does not alter its approval or make it unsafe.

6. Portable evaporative cooler.

7. Self-contained refrigeration system containing 10 pounds (4.54 kg) or less
of refrigerant and actuated by motors of I horsepower (746 W) or less.

5. Plumbing:

I. The stopping of leaks in drains. water. soil. waste or vent pipe; provided.
however. that if any concealed trap, drainpipe. water. soil. waste or vent
pipe becomes defective and it becomes necessary to remove and replace
the same with new material. such work shall be considered as new work,
and a permit shall be obtained and inspection made as provided in this
code.

2. The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks in pipes. valves or
fixtures, and the removal and reinstallation of water closets, provided that
such repairs do not involve or require the replacement or rearrangement of
valves, pipes or fixtures.

Section 106.2.1.1 is added to the IEBC to read as follows: 

106.2.1.1 Design Professional. All commercial and multifamily construction 
documents shall be prepared by a Maryland Licensed registered design 
professional. Construction documents shall be signed, sealed, and include the 
titleblock certification statement as required by Maryland State law (COMAR 
09.21.02.04 and 09.23.03.09) 

Section 106.2.3 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows: 

106.2.3 Means of egress.The construction documents shall show in sufficient 
detail the location, construction. size and character of all portions of the means of 
egress in compliance with the provisions of this code. The construction 
documents shall designate the number of occupants to be accommodated in every 
work area of every floor and in all affected rooms and spaces. 

Section 106.3.3 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows: 

106.3.3 Phased approval. The building official is authorized to issue a permit for 
the construction of foundations or any other part of a building or structure prior to 
the construction documents for the whole building or structure having been 

141 



ORDINANCE NO. 06-24 

approved. The application for foundation permit shall include all relevant 
information. including but not limited to: setbacks. proposed building height and 
area. building construction type. and structural criteria. The holder of such permit 
for the foundation of a building or structure shall proceed at the holder's own risk 
with the building operation and without assurance that a geonit for the entire 
structure will be granted. 

Section 106.3.3.1 is added to the IEBC to read as follows: 

106.3.3.1 Phased construction. Where construction of a building or structure is 
proposed to be phased. the applicant shall include a phasing plan and narrative 
with the submittal of construction documents. Such phasing plan shall clearly 
identify the extent of the work area included in each phase and clearly identify 
how elements such as the means of egress. active and passive fire protection, 
accessible routes. and restroom access will be provided or maintained during 
construction. 

Section 108.2 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows: 

108.2 Schedule of permit fees. The fees shall be as established by resolution of 
the Mayor and Council. 

Section 108. 4 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows: 

108.4 Work commencing before permit issuance. Any person who commences 
work on an existing building, except as provided for in Section I 05.1. before 
obtaining the necessary permits shall be subject to an investigation fee as set forth 
by resolution. and I 00 percent of the usual permit fee. 

Section 108. 6 of the IEBC is deleted in its entirety. 

Section 110. 1 .1 is added to the IEBC to read as follows: 

110.1. 1 Change of tenant or ownership. Whenever the ownership or tenancy of 
any part of a non-residential building or space changes, application must be made 
for a certificate of occupancy. Any violations of this Section or any applicable 
code as related to fire or life safety codes must be corrected prior to the issuance 
of the certificate of occupancy. 

Section 110.3 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows: 

110.3 Temporary Occupancy. The building official may issue a temporary 
occupancy permit. A temporary occupancy permit may be issued if none of the 
remaining conditions to be complied with are a health or safety hazard. 

A temporary occupancy permit may not be issued for a single-unit detached 
dwelling. 

A temporary occupancy permit is valid for a period not to exceed thirty {30) days. 
in the discretion of the Building Official. 

For good cause. the Building Official may extend a temporary occupancy permit 
when requested for additional periods, in accordance with the City of Rockville 

142 



ORDINANCE NO. 06-24 

Zoning Ordinance Section 25.07.12: however no temporary occupancy permit, 
including any extensions, will be valid for more than sixty (60) days. 

Section 112.1 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows: 

112.1 Board of Adjustments and Appeals. Appeals of administrative 
interpretations or decisions made by the Code Official shall be administered in 
accordance with Chapter 5, Article I, Section 5-12 of the Rockville City Code. 

Sections 1 I 2.2. 1 I 2.3 and 1 I 2.4 of the IEBC are deleted in their entirety. 

Notwithstanding Section 09.12.58.03(C)(6) of the Maryland Rehabilitation Code, Section 
306 of the IEBC shall apply to existing buildings. 

Section 306.2 of the IEBC is amended to read as follows: 

306.2 Design. Buildings and facilities shall be designed and constructed to be 
accessible in accordance with this code, the Maryland Accessibility Code 
(COMAR 09.12.53), and the alteration and existing building provisions in ICC 
A 117. l, as applicable. 

Chapter 16 of the IEBC is amended by replacing all references to the International Fire 
Code with Chapter 9 of the Rockville City Code. 

Secs. 5�293-5-300 Reserved. 

143 



ORDINANCE NO. 06-24 

ARTICLE XIV. GREEN BUILDING REGULATIONS 

*** 

DIVISION 2. ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT 

Sec. 5-311. Administration. 

(a) The Chief of Zoning or his/her their designee will review projects for compliance
with this article during the design phase of new construction. This includes:

( 1) Reviewing the submitted green building checklists and supporting
documentation for completeness and accuracy, as it pertains to site
development.

(b) The Chief of Inspection Services or his/her their designee will review projects for
compliance with this article during the design phase of new construction. This
includes:

( 1) Reviewing the submitted green building checklists and supporting
documentation for completeness and accuracy, as it pertains to building
construction.

Sec. 5-312. Enforcement. 

The Chief of Inspection Services or his/her their designee will review projects for 
compliance with this article during construction and prior to occupancy. This includes: 

*** 

DIVISION 3. DEFINITIONS 

Sec. 5-316. Definitions. 

Words defined in this article are intended only for use with sections of this article or any 
document referred to in this article. 

* * *

City Manager means the City Manager for the City of Rockville, or his/her their designee.

* * *

DIVISION 4. NON-RESIDENTIAL AND MULTI-UNIT RESIDENTIAL GREEN 

BUILDINGS 

** *

144 



ORDINANCE NO. 06-24 

Sec. 5-322. Same-Amendments. 

The ICC International Green Construction Code, 2015 Edition (lgCC), is amended in the 
following respects: 

* * *

Section 102.6 of the lgCC is amended to read as follows: 

102.6 Existing structures. The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the 
date of adoption of this code shall be permitted to continue without change, except 
as is specifically covered in this code, the International Building Code, the 
International Existing Building Code, or the Rockville Fire Code, or as is deemed 
necessary by the eode offieial Building Official for the general safety and welfare 
of building occupants and the public. 

Section 106. 1 of the lgCC is amended to read as follows: 

*** 

106.1 Required. Any owner or authorized agent who intends to construct, enlarge, 
alter, repair, move, demolish, or change the occupancy of a building or structure, 
or to erect, install, enlarge, alter, repair, remove, convert or replace any energy, 
electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system, the installation of which is 
regulated by this code, or to cause any such work to be done, shall first make 
application to the eode official Building Official and obtain the required permit 
under the applicable code or regulation relevant to the intended work. A Green 
Building application will be filed with the Inspection Services Division; however, 
a separate permit shall not be issued under this code. Exemptions from permit 
requirements shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to be done in 
any manner in violation of the provisions of this code or any other applicable laws, 
codes or ordinances of this jurisdiction. 

Section 108 of the lgCC is amended to read as follows: 

108 Board of Adjustments and Appeals. Appeals of administrative 
interpretations or decisions made by the code official Building Official shall be 
administered in accordance with Chapter 5, Article I, Section 5-.U. of the Rockville 
City Code. 

Section 301.1.l of the lgCC is amended to read as follows: 

301.1.1 Application. The requirements contained in this code are applicable to 
buildings, or portions of buildings. As indicated in Section l O 1.3, these buildings 
shall meet either the requirements of ASHRAE 189.1 or the requirements contained 
in this code or demonstrate compliance using an equivalent option that must be first 

145 



ORDINANCE NO. 06-24 

* * *

*** 

approved by the cede effieial Building Official and where the applicant 
demonstrates equivalency and compliance. 

Section 902.1.1.1 of the lgCC is amended to read as follows: 

*** 

902.1.1.1 Qualifications of approved agencies. An approved agency shall be 
qualified and shall demonstrate competence, to the satisfaction of the eede effieial 
Building Official, for the commissioning of the particular type of construction or 
operation. The registered design professional in responsible charge and engineers 
of record involved in the design of the project are permitted to act as the approved 
agency provided those personnel meet the qualification requirements of this section 
to the satisfaction of the eede effieial Building Official. The approved agency shall 
provide written documentation to the cede official Building Official demonstrating 
competence and relevant experience or training. Experience or training shall be 
considered relevant where the documented experience or training is related in 
complexity to the same type of commissioning activities for projects of similar 
complexity and material qualities. 

Section A/03.2 of the lgCC is amended to read as follows: 

*** 

Al03.2 Required number of and selection of project electives. A total of not less 
than 10 project electives shall be selected by the owner or the owner's authorized 
agent from Table Al03.2. Selected project electives shall be applied as mandatory 
requirements for the project. Selected project electives shall be communicated to 
the code official Building Official by means of checking the appropriate boxes in 
the tables and providing a copy of the tables, or by inclusion of a list of selected 
project electives, with the construction documents. 

DIVISION 5. ONE-AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLING REQUIREMENTS 

Sec. 5-333. Rockville Green Homes required. 

Homes must achieve a minimum Silver performance level in Chapters 5 through 10 of the 
ICC 700-2015 (National Green Building Standard) or equivalent system that must be first 
approved by the code official Building Official and where the applicant demonstrates equivalency 
and compliance. 

146 



ORDINANCE NO. 06-24 

SECTION II - This ordinance shall become effective on May 29, 2024, except for the following 

amendments, which shall become effective on December 1, 2024: 

NOTE: 

- Incorporation of Chapter 11 of the IBC, 2021 Edition, as amended by Section 5-87 this

ordinance;

- Incorporation of the following sections of the IECC, 2021 Edition, as amended by

Section 5-162 of this ordinance: Sections C402. l .1; C402. l .1.1; C402. l .2; C403 .4.1.6;

C404.2.l; C404.10; C405.2; C405.13; C405.14; C405.14.1; C405.15; C405.15.l;

C405. l 6, including all subsections; C406. l ;  C406.5. l ;  R401.2.5; R402. l; R403. l. l;

R403.5.4; R404.4, including all subsections; R404.5, including all subsections; R404.6,

including all subsections; R404.7, including all subsections; and

- Incorporation of Section 306 of the IEBC, 2021 Edition, as amended by Section 5-292

of this ordinance.

********************************* 

Strikethr01::1gh indicates material deleted. 

Underlining indicates material added. 

Asterisks * * * indicate material unchanged by this ordinance. 

I hereby certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of an Ordinance 

adopted by the Mayor and Council of Rockville at its meeting of May 20, 2024. 

;/�yafl, 
4
� 

City Clerk/Director of Council Operation 

147 




