City of .
Rockville
Community Planning

& Development Services

]
I'§

Photo credit: Clark Reed

Updates to the City's Green
Building Codes

Public Review Draft
October 2025



City of .
Rockville

Community Planning
& Development Services

Table of Contents
INEFOAUCTION ettt bbb
RESOUICTES ..ottt sttt e st et
HOW tO Share YOUTI COMIMENTS ....eeeieeeiecieetsseesiseesiseesssessssessssesssses st ssssessssessssssssanes
IMPIEMENTATION TIMEIINE .ot saeae
Article XIV - Significant AMENAMENTS ...t sssaens
International Green Construction Code - Significant Amendments. ..................
National Green Building Standard - Significant Amendments ...,

Proposed OrdiNnancCe CONTENT ...ttt sansees



City of .
Rockville

Community Planning
& Development Services

Introduction

The City of Rockville aims to effectively administer and enforce its building regulations
using the latest codes and standards. Building codes and standards are the key
instruments used by the Inspection Services Division (ISD) of the Department of
Community Planning and Development Services (CPDS), to carry out and fulfill the city's
mission and obligation to protect and ensure quality of life, well-being and sustainability
for its citizens, businesses, visitors and structures. These are the governing regulations
for building design and construction standards and include administrative and
technical requirements for all aspects of the permitting, review, and inspection process.

The Green Building Regulations are

These local amendments will be presented to Mayor & Council for Introduction and
Possible Adoption of the Ordinance after the close of the public comment period. The
public commment received through the online form (link included below) will be included
in the presentation for Mayor & Council's consideration.

Public feedback is an important part of this process, and this document has been
prepared to be transparent and collaborative in this effort. The content of the proposed
ordinance has been provided, with “track changes” showing where text has been
deleted, added, or relocated.

Changes are both administrative and technical in nature, and are generally limited to
what staff have identified as minimum necessary changes to clarify intent, safeguard

the public, improve equity, and meet the City's specific goals. Thank you for being a part
of this process!

Resources

Chapter 5, Article XIV of the Rockville City Code

2021 International Green Construction Code (IgCQC)

2020 National Green Building Standard (NGBS)

NGBS Certification



https://library.municode.com/md/rockville/codes/code_of_ordinances?nodeId=CICO_CH5BUPRMARE_ARTXIVGRBURE
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IGCC2021P1/preface
https://www.nahb.org/forms/open/icc-700-2020-ngbs-signup
https://www.ngbs.com/get-certified

City of .
Rockville

Community Planning
& Development Services

How to Share Your Comments

The City of Rockville's Department of Community Planning and Development Services
needs your feedback to help shape the future of green building regulations in our
community. Staff has reviewed the 2021 International Green Construction Code (IgCCQC)
and the 2020 National Green Building Standard (NGBS) and developed proposed local

amendments. You can comment on the proposed updates by visiting this site or
scanning the QR Code below.

City of Rockville - Updates to the
City's Green Building Codes



https://forms.office.com/Pages/ResponsePage.aspx?id=-vEaxFXpVUe4RqTjVjMKz8EGbE_EXuhJqY3GOfSieqxUNkdKUE9GWldWWk1aUk84R0lZNTFNNkQ2WC4u

City of .
Rockville

Community Planning
& Development Services

Implementation Timeline

The proposed amendments will be brought to Mayor and Council at the December 15,
2025 meeting. Staff is proposing that amendments will generally take effect six months
after adoption, with certain exceptions extending this implementation period for

projects that have a signed design contract and have substantially completed design
prior to the implementation date.

Article XIV - Green Building Regulations
Significant Amendments

The layout and content of Article XIV has changed, with some sections being relocated.
These are the significant or notable local amendments.

1. Scoping. Both the International Green Construction Code (IgCC) and the National
Green Building Standard (NGBS) have scoping provisions, so the scoping that was
originally separate in Article XIV has been relocated via amendments to the scoping
language in the IgCC and the NGBS.

2. Definitions. Both the IgCC and the NGBS contain robust definition sections, making
the definitions located separately in Article XIV unnecessary.



City of .
Rockville

Community Planning
& Development Services

International Green Construction Code (IgCC)
Significant Amendments

The 2021 International Green Construction Code (IgCC) serves as the model code for the
City's green building regulations pertaining to non-residential and certain multi-family
residential structures. These are the significant or notable local amendments.

1. Use of National Green Building Standard for certain multifamily residential or
mixed-occupancy projects. A new proposed section (101.3.1.1) allows flexibility to comply
with either the provisions of the IgCC or the provisions of the NGBS (where applicable).
Where an applicant opts to utilize the NGBS, the project must obtain a minimum NGBS
Silver Level Certification from an accredited third-party verifier. This allows applicants to
pursue a compliance path that aligns with their specific goals for a structure.

2. Deletion of substantial portions of Chapter 5. Chapter 5 of the IgCC addresses Site
Sustainability, and is focused more on the site itself than the structure. There are various
sections of the City's Code; such as the Zoning Ordinance, the Forest and Tree
Preservation Ordinance, Floodplain Management, etc.; that regulate the development of
a site. Deletion of portions of Chapter 5 of the IgCC defers to these existing ordinances to
regulate the site selection and development.

3. Modification of Section 701.3.2. Section 701.3.2 requires applicable building projects
to contain on-site photovoltaic (Solar PV) systems with a capacity based on 2 Watts per
square foot of gross roof area over conditioned and semiheated spaces. An exception
exists for use of renewable energy systems (other than solar) that provide an equal or
greater annual energy production. The proposed amendment adds another exception
that allows building owners to use off-site renewable energy systems that result in an
equal or greater annual energy production, where the owner can provide
documentation to demonstrate compliance. This allows some flexibility for participation
in Community Solar Projects or other green energy initiatives that are not on-site.

4. Additional EV-Charging Infrastructure Requirements. The currently adopted
amendments to the International Energy Conservation Code (IECC) contain
requirements for installation of EV-Charging Infrastructure on applicable projects. The
provisions in the IgCC are primarily applied to New Construction, and the percentage of
required spaces is enhanced over the baseline in the IECC. There are several trade-offs
and exceptions, so each case will have to be assessed individually to determine the
requirements, but the baselines established in proposed Table 701.3.6 are as follows:

OCCUPANCY EVSE EVSE EVSE
GROUP INSTALLED READY CAPABLE
Grg:‘f;‘?‘gi E, 5% (+3%) 10% (+2%) 25% (+15%)

Groups R-1, R-2,

R-4 15% (+5%) 25% (+15%) 65% (+35%)




City of .
Rockville

Community Planning
& Development Services

National Green Building Standard (NGBS)
Significant Amendments

The 2020 ICC 700 National Green Building Standard (NGBS) serves as the model code
for the City's green building regulations pertaining to one- and two-family dwellings and
certain multi-family residential or mixed-occupancy structures. The NGBS is slightly
different from the IgCC in that the standard is set up as a scoring model, offering
flexibility for projects to achieve different levels of adherence to the standard. As such,
there are no significant proposed amendments to the criteria. There are a few
significant amendments pertaining to Certification.

1. Certification required. Currently, no certification is required for projects following the
NGBS. The proposed change will require projects to obtain a minimum "NGBS Certified"
certification. This will require applicants to select a third-party verifier prior to beginning
their project. Verifiers are accredited by Home Innovations Research Labs, and must
register the project through the NGBS online portal at the time of permit application.
There is a nominal fee for the certification, and verifiers fees vary based on verifier and
type of project. To learn more about NGBS Green Certification, you can visit
http://www.ngbs.com

2. Proof of Registration Required. \With requiring the certification, submittal of
construction documents will become significantly easier. Applicants will no longer need
to complete the "Supplementary Green Requirements Form" or demonstrate
compliance with the NGBS at building permit application. Instead, applicants will work
with their third-party verifier to ensure the project is registered in the NGBS online
portal. The Building Plans Examiners will have access to a version of the portal and will
be able to quickly verify that a project has been registered. Applicants will also be
encouraged to submit registration documentation along with their construction
documents for a more expedient review.


https://www.ngbs.com/

Chapter 5
BUILDING AND PROPERTY MAINTENANCE REGULATIONS

* %%

ARTICLE XIV. GREEN BUILDING REGULATIONS

DIVISION 1. GENERALLY

Sec. 5-301. Scope.

This article places additional "green building" requirements on certain_structures-sizes-and

various types of new construction and redevelopment activities within Rockville.




Secs. 5-302306—5-310. Reserved.

DIVISION 2. ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT

skokok

Created: 2025-06-10 11:01:32 [EST]
(Supp. No. 16, Update 2)

Page 2 of 27



Secs. 5-3147—5-320. Reserved.

DIVISION 34. NON-RESIDENTIAL AND MULTI-UNIT RESIDENTIAL STRUCTURESGREEN
BUILDINGS

Sec. 5-321. International Green Construction Code—Adopted.

The International Code Council (ICC) International Green Construction Code, 2021 2645
Edition, as modified herein, is hereby adopted as the green construction code for the City. One
(1) copy of such publication as adopted shall be housed by the Inspection Services Division and
made available for inspection by the public during regular office hours. Any amendment or
change in such publication promulgated by the International Code Council shall not become a
part of this article until adopted by ordinance. References to other ordinances and codes of the
City shall be interpreted and applied in accordance with the terms and effect of such ordinances
and codes at the time of such application and interpretation.

Sec. 5-322. Same—Amendments.

The ICC International Green Construction Code, 2021 2045-Edition (IgCC), is amended in
the following respects:

k%

Created: 2025-06-10 11:01:32 [EST]
(Supp. No. 16, Update 2)

Page 3 of 27



Section 101.3 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

101.3 Scope. Except as outlined in section 101.3.1 or elsewhere in the Rockville City Code, Fhe
the provisions of this code shall apply to the design, construction, addition, alteration, equipment,

change of occupancy, relocation, replacement, demolition and removal of every building or
structure or any appurtenances connected or attached to such buildings or structures and to the
building site on which the building is located. Occupancy cla551ﬁcat10ns shall be determmed in
accordance with the [nternattonal Buzldzng Code

2




Section 101.3.1 of the IGCC is amended to read as follows:
101.3.1 (2.2) Applicability. The provisions of this code do not apply to the following:

1. Single-family dwellings and their accessory structures.

2. Multiple-family dwellings of three-stories or fewer above grade.

3. Manufactured houses (mobile homes).

4. Manufactured houses (modular).

5. Temporary structures.

6. Building projects that use none of the following:

1. Electricity
2. Fossil fuels
3. Water

7. Additions to existing buildings that do not exceed 7.500 gross square feet in
new area.

8. Alterations to existing buildings where the work area does not exceed 7,500
oross square feet and 50% of the gross floor area of the building.

9. Buildings constructed using an alternative compliance path, such as USGBC
LEED (minimum Silver level or equivalent), where such compliance path is
approved by the building official and, where applicable, certification is obtained
from the applicable certification bodies.

Section 101.3.1.1 is added to the IeCC to read as follows:

101.3.1.1 Use of National Green Building Standard. Where a project is covered under
the scope of the /CC 700 National Green Building Standard, 2020 edition as modified in
Division 4 of this article, the project may comply with the NGBS in lieu of the provisions
of this code, provided such project obtains a minimum NGBS Silver Level Certification.

Section 101.5.1 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

101.5.1 Jurisdictional Options. The provisions indicated as Jurisdictional Requirements
in Table 101.5.1 are mandatory provisions for all projects.

Table 101.5.1 of the IeCC is amended to read as follows:

JURISDICTIONAL
REQUIREMENT

SECTION SECTION TITLE




Chapter 5—Site Sustainability

501.3.5.2(5.3.5.2)

Mitigation of Heat Island Effect—Walls

501.3.6 (5.3.6)

501.3.7.2.2 (5.3.7.2.2)

501.3.7.2.3 (5.3.7.2.3)

501.3.7.2.5(5.3.7.2.5)

501.3.8.1 (5.3.8.1)

Reduction of Light Pollution

Bicycle Parking [ ocation
Bicycle Parking, Horizontal Parking Racks

Bicycle Parking, Security and Visibility

Building Site Waste Management—Diversion
Percentage

Chapter 6—Water Use Efficiency

601.3.1.2.1(a.3)
6.3.1.2.1(a,3)

601.3.1.2.1(a4)
6.3.1.2.1(a.4)

601.3.4 (6.3.4)

601.3.5.2 (6.3.5.2)

Irrigation System Design, Master Valve

Irrigation System Design, Flow Sensors

Special Water Features

Consumption Data Collection

601.3.5.3 (6.3.5.3)

Data Storage and Retrieval

601.3.9 (6.3.9)

Dual Water Supply Plumbing

Chapter 7—Energy Efficiency

701.4.2.1 (7.4.2.1)

Building Envelope Requirements

701.4.2.3 (7.4.2.3)

Single Rafter Roof Insulation

701.4.2.4 (7.4.2.4)

High-speed Doors

701.4.2.7 (71.4.2.7)

Permanent Projections

701.4.2.10 (7.4.2.10)

Orientation

701.4.3.2 (7.4.3.2)

Ventilation Controls for Densely Occupied Spaces

>~
z
o

>~
z
o

>~
z
o

>
z
)

__75% X_50%

X No

__No

>~
z
o

>~
z
o

>~
z
o

701.4.3.4(7.4.3.4)

Economizers

701.4.3.5(7.4.3.5)

Zone Controls




701.4.3.7(7.4.3.7) Exhaust Air Energy Recovery X No
701.4.3.8 (7.4.3.8) Kitchen Exhaust Systems X No
701.4.4.3 (7.4.4.3) Insulation for Spa Pools X No
7014631 (g Oscupmey Sensor Contols iy Commercialand
701.4.6.3.2 (7.4.6.3.2)  Automatic Controls for Egress and Security Lighting ~ X No
701.4.7.2 (7.4.7.2) Supermarket Heat Recovery __No
701.4.7.4 (7.4.7.4) Programmable Thermostats No
701.4.7.5 (7.4.7.5) Refrigerated Display Cases No
701.5.4(7.5.4) Energy Simulation Aided Design X No
Chapter 8—Indoor Environmental Quality

um ] Outdoor Air Ozone Removal __No
801.3.1.4.2 (8.3.1.4.2)  Exfiltration No
801.3.3.4(8.3.3.4) Interior Sound Reverberation No
801.3.9[8.3.9 Exterior Views X No
801.4.1.3(8.4.1.3) Shading for Offices No
Chapter 9—Materials and Resources

901.3.1.2(9.3.1.2) Total Waste X No
Chapter 10—Construction and Plans for Operation
¥ roe e
1001.7 (107 i/i)sz‘iglrsigucnon Building Flush-out and Air No
1001.10 (10.10) Service Life Plan No
1001.11.2 (10.11.2) Transportation Management Plan, Owner-occupied X No

Building Projects or Portions of Building Projects




1001.11.3 (10.11.3) Transportation Management Plan, Building Tenant X No

Section 102.1 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

102.1 Code Conflicts. Where there is a conflict between a general requirement and a
specific requirement of this code, the specific requirement shall be applicable. Where, in
any specific case, different sections of the code specify different materials, methods of
construction, or other requirements, the most practical requirement to meet the intent of
the code, as determined by the building official, shall govern.

Section 102.4 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

102.4 Referenced codes and standards. The following codes and local amendments
thereto shall be considered part of the requirements of this code: the International Building
Code (IBC), the International Energy Conservation Code® (IECC®), the International
Existing Building Code® (IEBC®), Rockville Fire Code, the International Fuel Gas Code®
(IFGC®), the International Mechanical Code® (IMC®), the International Plumbing Code®
(IPC®), the International Property Maintenance Code (IPMC), and the International
Residential Code® (IRC®).

Section 102.4.1 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

102.4.1 Conflicting Provisions. Where conflicts occur between provisions of this code
and referenced codes and standards, the most restrictive provisions, as determined by the
building official, shall apply.

Section 102.6 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

102.6 Existing structures. The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the date of
adoption of this code shall be permitted to continue without change, except as is specifically
covered in this code, the International Building Code, the International Existing Building
Code, the International Property Maintenance Code, or the Rockville Fire Code, or as is
deemed necessary by the Building Official for the general safety and welfare of building
occupants and the public.

Section 103 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
sksksk
Section LOZIE C the TeCC is deloted

Section 108.2 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

108.2 Schedule of permit fees. Where a permit is required, a fee for each permit shall be
paid as required, in accordance with the schedule as established by resolution of the
Mayor and Council.

Section 108.4 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

108.4 Work commencing before permit issuance. Any person who commences any
work before obtaining the necessary permits, except as provided for elsewhere in the City
Code, shall be subject to an investigation fee as set forth by resolution, in addition to the
required permit fees.




Section 108.6 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 111468 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

108 Beard-of Adjustments-and1H1-Means of Appeals. Appeals of administrative

interpretations or decisions made by the Building Official shall be administered in
accordance with Chapter 5, Article I, Section 5-12 of the Rockville City Code.

Section 301.1 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:
301.1 (3.1) General.

Certain terms, abbreviations, and acronyms are defined in this section for the purposes of
this code. These definitions are applicable to all sections of this code.

Terms that are not defined herein, but that are defined in standards that are referenced
herein (Informative Note: e.g.. ANSI/ASHRAE/IES Standard 90.1), shall have the
meanings as defined in those standards.

Other terms that are not defined shall have their ordinarily accepted meanings within the
context in which they are used. Ordinarily accepted meanings shall be based on American
standard English language usage. as documented in an approved unabridged dictionary.

Where terms defined herein appear elsewhere in the Rockville City Code, such terms shall
have the meaning herein applied only in reference to the application of this code. Where
there is a conflict between definitions, the building official shall determine the applicable
definition.

Section 501.3.1 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety, including all subsections.

Section 501.3.2 of the 1eCC is deleted in its entirety, including all subsections.

Section 501.3.3 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety, including all subsections.
Section 501.3.4 of the 1eCC is amended to read as follows:

501.3.4 (5.3.4) Stormwater management. Stormwater management systems shall be in
accordance with Chapter 19 of the Rockville City Code.

Sections 501.3.4.1 through 501.3.4.6 of the IgCC are deleted in their entirety
Section 501.3.5.1 and 501.3.5.2 of the IgCC are deleted in their entirety
Section 501.3.5.5 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

501.3.5.5 (5.3.5.5)Vegetated terrace and roofing systems.

Vegetated terrace and roofing systems, where provided in accordance with Section
501.3.5.3 (5.3.5.3), shall comply with the following:

1. All plantings shall be capable of withstanding the microclimate conditions of the
vegetated area, including but not limited to wind, precipitation, and
temperature. Plants shall be selected and placed to provide foliage coverage of not
less than 50% of designed area of vegetation based on the anticipated plant growth
within two years of the issuance of the final certificate of occupancy. Construction
documents shall be submitted that show the planting location and anticipated two-
year foliage coverage of the plantings. Duplicate coverage shall not be credited
where multiple plants cover the same area. Invasive plants shall not be planted.




2. The growing medium shall be designed for the physical conditions and local climate
to support the plants selected. The planting design shall include measures to protect
the growing medium until the plants are established. The maximum wet weight and
water-holding capacity of a growing medium shall be determined in accordance
with ASTM E2399.

3. Non-vegetated clearances and borders shall be provided in accordance with
the Rockville Fire Code

4. Plantings shall be capable of maintaining the function of the vegetated roof or
terrace as required by Section 1001.9.1 (10.9.1).

5. Irrigation of the vegetated roofs and terraces shall comply with Section
601.3.2.4 (6.3.2.4).

6. Installation of plantings shall be in accordance with the roof-covering
manufacturer’s installation instructions.

Section 501.3.6 of the I1eCC is deleted in its entirety, including all subsections.

Section 501.3.7 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety, including all subsections.
Section 501.3.8.1 of the IeCC is amended to read as follows:
501.3.8.1 (5.3.8.1)Building site waste management Plan.

A building site waste management plan shall be developed and implemented for
excavated soil, rock, and land-clearing debris. Land-clearing debris is limited to stumps
and vegetation. Diverted land-clearing debris and removed rock and soil shall not be sent
to sites where development activity is prohibited by Section 501.3.1.2 (5.3.1.2) or

to greenfields other than those being used for agricultural purposes or being developed as
part of a building project.

Not less than 50% of the land-clearing debris, excluding invasive plant materials, shall be
diverted from disposal in landfills and incinerators other than waste-to-energy systems
with an energy-recovery efficiency rate higher than 60%. Land-clearing debris
calculations shall be based on either weight or volume but not both. Receipts or other
documentation related to diversion shall be maintained through the course of
construction.

The plan shall address all of the following:

1. Land-clearing debris, rock, and soil to be diverted from disposal by composting,
recycling. or reuse.

Waste materials that will be diverted on-site.

The locations to which waste materials will be diverted off-site.

Soils to be stockpiled for future use at any location.

Woody waste to be used as fuel.

The destruction and disposal of invasive plant materials.

The methods of removal of any contaminated soils.

S A T

The treatment of vegetation to comply with the rules of government-designated
quarantine zones for invasive insect species.




Section 601.2 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

601.2 (6.2)Compliance. All provisions of Chapter 6 are mandatory provisions.

EXCEPTION: Projects located within Washington Suburban Sanitary Commision
(WSSC) Jurisdiction shall comply with WSSC requirements and are not required to
comply with Chapter 6 of this code.

Section 601.3.1 of the IeCC is deleted in its entirety, including all subsections

Section 601.3.2.5 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.

Section 601.3.2.6 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 601.3.4 of the 1eCC is deleted in its entirety.

Section 601.3.9 of the I1eCC is deleted in its entirety, including all subsections

Section 701.3.1 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

701.3.1 (7.3.1) General. Building projects shall be designed to comply with the Energy
Conservation Code in addition to the requirements contained in this code.

Section 701.3.1.1 of the IeCC is amended to read as follows:

701.3.1.1 (7.3.1.1) Climate zones. Climate zone 4A shall be used for the City of
Rockville in determining the applicable requirements of this chapter.

Section 701.3.1.2 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 701.3.2 of the I1eCC is amended to read as follows:

701.3.2 (7.3.2) On-site renewable energy systems.

Building projects shall contain on-site photovoltaic systems with a rated capacity of not
less than 2 W/ft*(22 W/m?) multiplied by the horizontal projection of the gross roof
area over conditioned spaces and semiheated spaces. Documentation shall be provided to
the 4AH/J that indicates an exclusive chain of custody and ownership of the RECs from
the on-site renewable energy system to the building owner. RECs supplied from the on-
site renewable energy system shall be conveyed to and retired on behalf of the entity who
has financial or operational control over the building's electricity

consumption. RECs shall be tracked per Section 1001.9.8 (10.9.8). Where the

building owner cannot provide documentation on the chain of custody or ownership of
the RECs from the on-site renewable energy system, the building owner may provide
documentation to the 4H.J of an alternate supply contract for an equal or greater quantity
of replacement RECs from an alternate renewable energy source.

The building gross roof area used for calculation in Section 701.3.2 (7.3.2) excludes the

following:

1. Shaded areas that are defined as roof area where direct-beam sunlight is blocked by
structures or natural objects for more than 1500 annual hours between & a.m. and 4
p.m.




2. Areas of vegetated terrace and roofing systems compliant with Section 501.3.5.5

(5.3.5.5).

3. Areas designated for public occupancy. Parking areas shall not qualify for this
exclusion.

4. Areas designated for helipads.

Exceptions:

1. Building projects that have an annual daily average incident solar radiation available
to a flat plate collector oriented due south at an angle from horizontal equal to the
latitude of the collector location less than 1.2 kBtu/ft*s day (4.0 kWh/m?e day).

2. Renewable energy systems, other than photovoltaic systems, that result in an equal or
greater annual energy production

3. Capacity shall be permitted to be reduced to that required to provide at least 50% of
the simulated annual site energy consumption of the proposed building project in
accordance with Normative Appendix C.

4. Use of off-site Renewable energy systems that result in an equal or greater annual
energy production, where the owner provides RECs or other approved documentation
to demonstrate compliance with this section.

Section 701.3.6 and subsections are added to the IgCC to read as follows:

701.3.6 Electric Vehicle Charging Infrastructure. Parking facilities shall be provided
with electric vehicle charging infrastructure in accordance with this section and table
701.3.6.

Exception: Where the proposed activity is an alteration that does not include
exterior work, work in an existing parking facility, or creation of a new parking
facility, this section does not apply.

701.3.6.1 Minimum quantity. The minimum number of parking spaces provided with
electric vehicle infrastructure shall be based on the total number of parking spaces

provided and rounded up to the nearest whole number. Where reductions are applied in
accordance with Section 701.3.6.2 in no case shall fewer than one of each type of space

be provided.
701.3.6.1.1 More than one parking facility. Where more than one parking facility is

provided on a building site, the number of parking spaces provided with electric vehicle
infrastructure shall be calculated separately for each parking facility.

701.3.6.1.2 Serving multiple occupancies. Where one shared parking facility serves
multiple building occupancies, the required number of parking spaces provided with
electric vehicle infrastructure shall be determined proportionally based on the floor area
of each building occupancy.

701.3.6.1.3 Accessible spaces. The required number of parking spaces provided with
electric vehicle infrastructure that are designed for accessibility shall be in accordance
with Section 1107.2 of the International Building Code. None of the reductions permitted
by section C405.14.2 shall reduce the number of required accessible spaces.




701.3.6.2 Reductions. The minimum number of spaces required to be provided with

electric vehicle charging infrastructure may be reduced as follows:

1. The number of required EVSE-Installed spaces for Groups A, B, E. F. I. M and

S-2 Occupancies may be reduced by ten (10) for each DC Fast-

Charging EVSE installed.

2. Parking spaces designated for vehicles other than passenger vehicles are

permitted to be excluded from the total number of on-site parking spaces.

3. Parking spaces designated for quick transactions, such as takeout, pickup, and

drop-off are permitted to be excluded from the total number of on-site parking

Spaces.

4. EVSE-installed spaces above the minimum required number are permitted to be

installed to meet the minimum required number of EV-Ready Spaces or the

minimum required number of EV-Capable Spaces.

5. EV-Ready spaces above the minimum required number are permitted to be

installed to meet the minimum required number of EV-Capable Spaces.

6. The number of required EV-Capable Spaces for Groups R-1, R-2 and R-4

Occupancies may be reduced by 50% where a Long-Term EV Charging

Management Plan has been submitted and approved by the building official.

TABLE 701.3.6 ELECTRIC VEHICLE CHARGING INFRASTRUCTURE

REQUIREMENTS
OCCUPANCY EVSE EVSE READY EVSE CAPABLE
GROUP INSTALLED
Groups A, B, E, F, 5% 10% 25%
LM, S-2
Groups R-1. R-2, R- 15% 25% 65%
4

701.3.6.3 Classification of Spaces. The parking spaces required by this section shall be

classified in accordance with 701.3.6.3.1. 701.3.6.3.2. or 701.3.6.3.3.

701.3.6.3.1 EV-Capable Spaces. For a parking space to qualify as an EV-Capable Space,

the following requirements must be met:

1. A raceway or other approved means of cable protection, installed between the

panel and the point of termination.

2. The point of termination shall be an approved enclosure, such as a junction

box, and shall be installed within 36" (914 mm) of the parking space, or within

close proximity of the parking space, as determined by the Building Official.

3. Dedicated physical space shall be provided within the panel for future

installation of a 40-ampere overcurrent protective device.

4. Durable approved labels shall be installed at the panel and the point of

termination, identifying the infrastructure "For Electric Vehicle Charging"




701.3.6.3.2 EV Ready Spaces. For a parking space to qualify as an EV-Ready Space, a
dedicated 40-Ampere, 208/240v branch circuit shall be provided, which meets all of the
following requirements:

1. The branch circuit shall serve no other appliances or equipment

2. The branch circuit shall terminate in an approved enclosure within 36" (914
mm) of the parking space, or where site conditions prohibit, within close
proximity of the parking space, as determined by the Building Official.

3. The overcurrent protective device and the approved enclosure in which the
circuit terminates shall be provided with durable approved labels, identifying the
infrastructure "For Electric Vehicle Charging."

701.3.6.3.3 EV-Installed Spaces. Equipment serving EVSE-Installed Spaces shall meet
all of the following requirements:

1. The equipment shall meet the criteria for Level 2 charging established in § 12-
205 of the Maryland State Code.

Exception: Where connected to an approved Automatic Load
Management System (ALMS), the EVSE shall be permitted to supply a
reduced output, provided that every EVSE connected to the ALMS is
capable of charging at a minimum rate of 1.4 kW simultaneously.

2. The equipment shall be located within 36" of the parking space, or where site
conditions prohibit, within close proximity of the parking space, as determined by
the Building Official.

Section 701.4 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

701.4 (7.4) Prescriptive option. Where a more stringent requirement is provided in this
section, it supersedes the requirement in the Fnergy Conservation Code. For all other
criteria, the building project shall comply with the requirements of the Energy
Conservation Code.

Section 701.4.2 of the 1eCC is amended to read as follows:

701.4.2 (7.4.2) Building envelope. The building envelope shall comply with the Energy
Conservation Code, with the following modifications and additions.
701.4.2.1 (7.4.2.1)[JO] Building envelope requirements.

For a conditioned space, the building envelope shall comply with either the nonresidential or
residential requirements in Tables 701.4.2.1(1) through 701.4.2.1(4)

Exceptions:
1. Spaces that meet the requirements of Section 801.4.1 (8.4.1), regardless
of space area, are exempt from the SHGC criteria for skylights.




TABLE 701.4.2.1(1)

NONRESIDENTIAL BUILDING ENVELOPE REQUIREMENTS (OPAQUE

ELEMENTS)
Roofs
Assembly Maximum Insulation Min. R-Value
Insulation entirely above | U-0.030 R-30 c.i.
roof deck
Metal Buildings U-0.035 R-19+ R-11 Ls or R-25 +R-8 Ls
Attic and other U-0.020 R-49
Walls, above grade
Mass U-0.099 R-9.5 c.i.
Metal building U-0.057 R-0 + R-15.8 c.i.
Metal framed U-0.061 R-13 +R-7.5 c.i.
Wood framed and other U-0.061 R-13 + R-3.8 c.i. or R-20
Walls, below grade
Below-grade wall | C-0.113 | R-7.5 c.i.
Floors
Mass U-0.054 R-14.6 c.i.
Joist/framing U-0.031 R-30
Slab-on-grade floors
Unheated slabs F-0.49 R-15 for 24 in.
Heated slabs F-0.59 R-20 for 24 in.
Opaque doors
Nonswinging door U-0.29
Swinging door U-0.35
Garage door <14% U-0.29

| glazing

TABLE 701.4.2.1(2)

NONRESIDENTIAL BUILDING ENVELOPE REQUIREMENTS (FENESTRATION)

Fenestration Assembly Max. Assembly Max. SHGC Assembly Min.
U- VT/SHGC
Vertical Fenestration, 0% to 30% of wall
East- or West-
Facing
Fixed 0.34 0.36 0.34 1.10
Operable 043 0.33 0.32
Entrance Door 0.60 0.33 0.32
Skylight, 0% to 3% of Roof
All Types 0.48 | 0.38 \ NR

TABLE 701.4.2.1(3)

RESIDENTIAL BUILDING ENVELOPE REQUIREMENTS (OPAQUE ELEMENTS)




Roofs

Assembly Maximum Insulation Min. R-Value

Insulation entirely above U-0.030 R-30 c.i.
roof deck
Metal Buildings U-0.035 R-19 + R-11 Ls or R-25 +R-8 Ls
Attic and other U-0.020 R-49

Walls, above grade
Mass U-0.086 R-114c.i.
Metal building U-0.048 R-0 + R-19 c.i.
Metal framed U-0.061 R-13 + R-7.5 c.i.
Wood framed and other U-0.061 R-13 + R-3.8 c.i. or R-20

Walls, below grade
Below-grade wall C-0.087 | R-10c.i.

Floors

Mass U-0.048 R-16.7 c.i.
Joist/framing U-0.031 R-30

Slab-on-grade floors
Unheated slabs F-0.49 R-15 for 24 in.
Heated slabs F-0.65 R-20 for 24 in.

Opaque doors
Nonswinging door U-0.29
Swinging door U-0.35
Garage door <14% U-0.29
| glazing

TABLE 701.4.2.1(4)

RESIDENTIAL BUILDING ENVELOPE REQUIREMENTS (FENESTRATION)

Fenestration Assembly Max. | Assembly Max. SHGC Assembly Min.
U- VT/SHGC
Vertical Fenestration, 0% to 30% of wall
East- or West-
Facing
Fixed 0.34 0.36 0.34 1.10
Operable 043 0.33 0.32
Entrance Door 0.60 0.33 0.32
Skylight, 0% to 3% of Roof
All Types 0.48 | 0.38 | NR

Section 701.4.2.2 of the I1gCC is deleted in its entirety.

Section 701.4.2.3 of the IeCC is deleted in its entirety.

Section 701.4.2.6 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:




701.4.2.6 Vertical fenestration area. The total vertical fenestration area shall be less
than 40% of the gross wall area. This requirement supersedes the requirement in the
Energy Conservation Code.

Section 701.4.2.7 of the I1gCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 701.4.2.8 of the IeCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 701.4.3 of the IgCC is amended to read as follows:

701.4.3 Heating, ventilating, and air conditioning. The heating. ventilating, and air
conditioning shall comply with the Energy Conservation Code, with the following
modifications and additions.

Section 701.4.3.7 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 701.4.3.8 of the IeCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 701.4.4 of the 1gCC is amended to read as follows:

701.4.4 Service water heating. The service water heating shall comply with the Energy
Conservation Code, with the following modifications and additions.

Section 701.4.4.3 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 701.4.6.3.2 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 701.5.4 of the 1gCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 801.3.9 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.
Section 901.3.1.2 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.

Section 1001.11 of the IgCC is deleted in its entirety.




=]
E 13 buildi ; . loss ] Ves No
h%i—ght—abe&%g%&d%pl—afﬁeh%g
aeeesse&stmet&res,—aﬂefl—ﬂ?e—me—ef
let—upea—w%eh—thes&buﬂd—mgs—afe
located,shall- complywith JCEC700-
GPLA—HER—%SHE—DE@L@H@N%&—N—DJM—USEE =
o assessment ¥es Neo
Preservation-of Natural Resources =} jwil
402 o °
1= v
403 Stormwater-Management o @
Landscape trrigation-and-Outdoor = v |
o FEountains ¥Yes No | Xes
10514050 M V; orSoil = =2
and ¥Yes Neo




1= M &4
- _ Yes Neo | Yes
Building Site Waste Management vl =
407.1-407.3 i - =
: : FranspertationImpaet = vl
407.4 Preferred vehicle parking = o
& M |4
" Yes Neo | Yes
HeatIsland Mitigation vl g
Yes Ne
Site Lighting = 2 | &
M =)
= ' Yes Ne
Constracton-Waste- Management
M =)
ol di | from land6ill
504 :
Waste Management and Reeyeling
M =
o . Yes Ne
Material Sclection
& M |4
S06 Lamps = ACE
& M |4
QEEHLTER—érEMERGJLQQNSERIQIﬂGMLEFHGIEMGIZe;@D—GO AISSTo
. Le EMISSION
o e ge e . . ¥%s. Ne
yd-ﬂsel-reﬁeﬂ—sha-l-l—mdw&te—a—z-EPI—ef. Oeceupaney:
. o, . . 1%
which-itintendsto-require-enhaneed | zEPL- 50
6@% . '. .
%&e%ﬁ[etemg—kﬁ[eaﬁemg—&nd‘ 5 M 1=
— Repeorting Yes Ne
Automated Demand-Response
& M |4
e %%&DPQ%&SW Yes No | Yes
Buﬁd—l—&g—E-rwelep%Sys%ems M =
606 theht o =
Buldine Mechanteal Systems{as
amended) o N
¥Yes Ne




EeonomizerSystems v |
Ne | ¥es
BuildineServico W oot =
Systems-(as-amended) Ne
Buildine Eloctrical B 1 Z =
Eighting Systems Ne | ¥es
Sooci T Eou Z =
Ne | ¥es
Onstte Renewable Energy-Systems v Wi
Ne | ¥es
E S - 1 =
Completion No
Outeome-Based Pathway {w:|
Requirements Neo
W - od 2
No
Fo2-702-4 Fittinsandixture-consamption =
| b Deinkine & i | No
Apphanees 2 |3
Ne | ¥es
702.6-70219 Munieipal Reclaimed-Water-through jwil
EilmProeessors Neo
HVACSystems-and-Equipment(as =)
amended) Ne
Water Treatment Devices-and jwil
Equipment Ne
BuildineC ol , =
Opcrations and Matntenance No
Eneilitat
HVACSystems =}
Ne
SoecificTnd i Oual i =2
Pollutant- Control Measures Neo
Post-ConstructionPre-Oeceupaney [w R il
Bascline IAQ Testing No | Xes
Prohibited Material =
No
Notorial Ermiosi TPoll Z =
Control Neo | ¥es




; . . . @ E
9.9% . . ¥%s Ne
B-H-l%d—l—&g—@p%ll&t-}eﬂﬁ—&ﬁd ‘ {wi| =)
994 . . ¥es Ne
B-H-l%d—l—&g—@p%ll&t-}eﬂﬁ—&ﬁd {wi| =)
CHAPTER 1. EXISTING BUILDINGS = =
Chapter 10 Existing Buildings 1= Vi)
Yes Ne
CHAPTER H-EXISTING BULDING ST EDEVELOPMENT
Chapter H- Existing Building Site Development | & vl
Yes Neo

3
gm













ALO86 Fotal VOCHimit 8-Yes =No
AHO-4053 Native Plant Landseaping 8-Yes aNe
AHO-4074 Preferred-Vehicle Parking =-Yes =Ne
AHO-505 Material Selection =-Yes =Ne
AHH-506 Lamps =-Yes =Ne
AHO-604 Automated Demand-Response(Auto-DR) - nfrastructure g-Yes aNe
AHO-606-51+ Economizer-Systems 2-Yes 5Ne
6089

AHO-610 Oansite Renewable Energy-Systems =-Yes 5Ne
AHO-7042 Water Usage Metering =Yes =Neo
AHO-702.5 Applianees =Yes =Neo
AHO-704 Water Freatment Devicesand-Equipment =Yes =Neo
AHO-867 Acousties =Yes =Ne
AHO-868 Daylighting =-Yes =Ne

Secs. 5-323—5-330. Reserved.

DIVISION 45. RESIDENTIAL STRUCTURES-ONE-—-ANDTWOFAMILY DWELLING
REQUIREMENTS

Sec. 5-331. Applicability.

The requirements of this division shall be applicable to newly constructed and substantially
reconstructed: ; i elline indi in : ; :




1. One- and two-family dwellings and townhouses; and
2. Group R-2 multiple-family dwellings of three stories or fewer above grade.

Sec. 5-332. National Green Building Standard, AdoptedGreenbuilding-cheeklist required.

The ICC 700 National Green Building Standard (NGBS), 2020 Edition, as modified herein,
is hereby adopted as the residential green construction code for the City. One (1) copy of such
publication as adopted shall be housed by the Inspection Services Division and made available
for inspection by the public during regular office hours. Any amendment or change in such
publication promulgated by the International Code Council shall not become a part of this article
until adopted by ordinance. References to other ordinances and codes of the City shall be
interpreted and applied in accordance with the terms and effect of such ordinances and codes at

the tlme of such apphcatlon and 1nterpretat10n AH—eﬂe—aﬂd—Nfe—famﬂ-ydeemﬂg—&s—m&ea%e%ﬂ

Sec. 5-333. Reekville GreenHomes-Certification required.

New structures subject to the provisions of this division must earn the NGBS Certified
certlﬁcatlon prior to 1ssuance of Cer‘uﬁcate of Occupancv Hemes—m&st—aehev&a—mmmbm&

Sec. 5-334. National Green Building Standard —Amendments.

The ICC 700 National Green Building Standard, 2020 Edition (NGBS), is amended in the
following respects:

Section 103.1 of the NGBS is amended to read as follows:

103.1 Proof of Registration Required. Prior to issuance of building permits for projects
subject to the provisions of this standard, applicants shall provide proof of project
registration for NGBS Certification.

Section 103.2 is added to the NGBS to read as follows:

103.2 Conflicts. Where there is a conflict between a general requirement and a specific
requirement of this standard, the specific requirement shall be applicable. Where, in any
specific case, different sections of the standard specify different materials, methods of
construction or other requirements, the most practical requirement to meet the intent of
the code, as determined by the building official, shall govern.

103.2.1 Conflicting Provisions. Where conflicts occur between provisions of this
standard and referenced codes and standards, the most restrictive provisions, as
determined by the building official, shall apply.

This table in Section 1402 of the NGBS is amended to read as follows:

ICC — International Code Council | www.iccsafe.org

Created: 2025-06-10 11:01:32 [EST]
(Supp. No. 16, Update 2)

Page 26 of 27



DOCUMENT DATE TITLE SECTION

All7.1 2017 Accessible and Usable Buildings and Facilities

IBC 2021 International Building Code

ICC-400 2012 Standard on the Design and Construction of Log Table 701.4.3.2(2)
Structures

IECC 2021 International Energy Conservation Code

IFGC 2021 International Fuel Gas Code

1gCC 2021 International Green Construction Code

IMC 2021 International Mechanical Code

IRC 2021 International Residential Code

IPC 2021 International Plumbing Code

IWUIC 2018 International Wildlife Urban Interface Code 503.1(8),

11.503.1(8)

sk sk sk sk sk sk sie sk sk sk sk sk st sk sk sk sk sk sk sk st skeoske sk skeoske skeoskeskeosk sk ks

NOTE: Strikethrough indicates material deleted.
Underlining indicates material added.

Asterisks * * * indicate material unchanged by this ordinance.

27



